25/05/2022, 11:19 Gmail - Fwd:

M Gma” Agib Majeed <viamed.agib.majeed@gmail.com>
Fwd:

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 25 May 2022 at 10:57

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi
Please can we send a quotation or proforma to Riju @ Orbis for 3x R-30V 0110040 including UPS costs.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Orbisbiomed Sales <sales@orbisbiomed.com>
Date: Wed, 25 May 2022 at 10:39

Subject: Re:

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Thanks Ryan kindly send the courier charges also so | can quote

Thanks & Regards
Riju Eapen Mathew

---- On Wed, 25 May 2022 13:12:59 +0400 Ryan Swaine<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote ----

Dear Riju

Thank you for your email.

The R-30V sensors (part no. 0110040) are USD $70 each EXW.

If you are happy with the pricing of the sensors, then we can look at the shipping costs for you.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
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On Wed, 25 May 2022 at 09:05, Orbis Biomed Trading LLC <sales@orbisbiomed.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

Hope you are doing good.

We have an enquiry for Oxygen sensor R-30V , qty 3 pcs (picture attached for reference)
Kindly send us your quotation with shipping charges to Dubai.

Regards,

Riju Eapen Mathew
Business Development Manager

Orbis Biomed Trading LLC

o P OBox 234271 DUBAI | UAE
[ ) T 04 878 6402 M: 054 322 4677

E: sales{@orbisbiomed.com
W: www . orbisbiomed.com
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