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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re[2]: Web site question

1 message

sajidalim@ymail.com <sajidalim@ymail.com> 17 May 2022 at 15:59
Reply-To: sajidalim@ymail.com
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Sajid Ali Mumtaz


house #52/2-D

waval line chaklala

Rawalpindi Pakistan


You tell us to send the post via please because there is a thief mafia everywhere in our country🤭

We will tell you about the courier later when our order is mature

--

Sent from Outlook Email App for Android

Tuesday, 17 May 2022, 07:32PM +05:00 from Kate Griffiths office@viamed.co.uk:


Thank you for your reply Sajid,

I need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to create an account for you.

Many thanks.


Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.
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On Tue, 17 May 2022 at 15:29, <sajidalim@ymail.com> wrote:

Dear Kate

Please send us a your's officially invoice for Qty @02
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Regard

Sajid

--

Sent from Outlook Email App for Android

Tuesday, 17 May 2022, 07:01PM +05:00 from Kate Griffiths office@viamed.co.uk:




Good afternoon,



Thank you for your enquiry via our website.  The price breaks for part number 0110049 - R-49V are as
follows:


1 = $ 63.50
EXW 
2 = $ 57.15 each

EXW 
3-10 = $ 53.98 each
EXW 
11 or more = $ 50.80 each

EXW
 
Or would you prefer the details of a business partner in Pakistan?


Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, bank charges and
insurance.  If so, I would need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to create an account for you.



Many thanks.



Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.



http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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