17/05/2022, 10:00 Gmail - Re: Quotation

M Gma“ Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Re: Quotation

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 17 May 2022 at 09:56

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>

Dear Divya
Thank you. The R-17MED sensors (0110017) are available from stock and are priced at USD $34.50 each EXW for
distributors.

One of my colleagues will be in contact shortly with a proforma invoice that will highlight the total costs with carriage.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 17 May 2022 at 06:59, Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com> wrote:

Hello Ryan,
We are looking for R17 oxygen sensor-10 nos.
Best regards,

Divya Sharma

Product Manager

Mob : +973 -33629448

Tel: 1 +973 - 17112344

Fax: : +973 - 17583324

Web: :www.navigamedical.com

Kingdom of Bahrain

NAVIGA

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/2/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1732985997780127174%7Cmsg-f%3A173306312...
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17/05/2022, 10:00 Gmail - Re: Quotation

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2022 3:52 PM

To: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>

Cc: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Subject: Re: Quotation

Dear Divya

Please can you let us know which sensors you need?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 16 May 2022 at 13:30, Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com> wrote:

Dear Team,

Please send us a quotation for OXYGEN SENSOR-10 NOS urgently with shipping and the latest delivery
date to Bahrain along with warranty.

Waiting to hear from you at the earliest.

Best regards,

Divya Sharma

Product Manager

Mob : +973 — 33629448
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Tel: : 4973 - 17112344
Fax: 1 +973 - 17583324
Web: : www.navigamedical.com

Kingdom of Bahrain

NAVIGA
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