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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen sensor R-17VAN

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 12 May 2022 at 09:25
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Chris James <chris@airsystemsgroup.com>

Date: Thu, 12 May 2022 at 08:52

Subject: Oxygen sensor R-17VAN

To: <sales@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi good morning 


Please could you issue by return a proforma invoice for  1 x R-17VAN sensor, I will therefore make a bacs payment
and advise once done.


Many thanks 


Invoice address 

Air Systems Ltd 

Unit 5 Goosey Lodge Farm 

Wymington

Northants 

NN10 9LU


Christopher James

Air Systems Group Ltd

01933 418860

07770901530

Sent from my iPhone
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