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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma invoice as requested

1 message

Felix Badoo <f.badoo@centreforsurgery.com> 26 April 2022 at 13:38
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>, accounts@centreforsurgery.com

Hello Kate,

I have spoken to my boss and I can confirm we are happy to pay £12.00

Thank you.

On 26/04/2022 12:00 Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Felix,

Further to our conversation this morning, we are happy to send the goods if you can confirm you are happy to pay the
£12.  Please see attached information from our accounts team.  No internal paperwork was produced as no goods were
sent.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I
am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to
use email where possible.
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On Tue, 26 Apr 2022 at 11:17, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:



Good morning Felix,

Thank you for your payment for £126.  Unfortunately, the payment of £12 is still outstanding as per my
previous email.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Mon, 25 Apr 2022 at 13:46, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:



Good afternoon Felix,

Further to our telephone conversation earlier today, please see attached proforma invoice. 
Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.

Also, from your last order in April 2021 (which was refunded), there is an outstanding
amount owed to us of £12.  Below is a screenshot of the email my colleague sent to
D.Fitouri.

When you pay, please could you add £12 to the amount?  If you would like to pay by card
(we do not accept American Express), please let me know and I can arrange this.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff
to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

Regards

Felix Badoo

Finance and Admin. Department.

E: f.badoo@centreforsurgery.com 
W: https://centreforsurgery.com




Centre for Surgery is a trading name of M Sarwar Limited

Registered office address:
Unit 2 Colne Way Court


Colne Way


Watford


HertfordshireWD24 7NE


United Kingdom


Company registration number: 12148209


VAT registration number: 345611020


CQC provider ID: 1-8123032215



This electronic message contains information from centreforsurgery which may be privileged or confidential. The information is intended
to be for the sole use of the individual(s) or entity named above and may also be privileged or exempt from disclosure under applicable
law. If you are not the intended recipient you must delete/destroy this email. Please be aware that any disclosure, copying, distribution
or use of this information is prohibited. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender and is not given or
endorsed by M Sarwar Limited. Any guarantees, variations, alterations or offers that are not part of our standard terms of business will
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please notify us by telephone or e-mail (to the number or address above) immediately. We reserve the right to intercept and read emails
sent or received by our employees. If you do not wish for your communications to be subjected to such scrutiny, you should not
communicate via this email system. Please note that calls to and from M Sarwar Limited are recorded and monitored for training and
security purposes. Internet communications are not guaranteed to be secure or without viruses. M Sarwar Limited does not accept
responsibility for any loss arising from unauthorised access to, or interference with, any Internet communications by any third party, or
from the transmission of any viruses. Replies to this email may be monitored by M Sarwar Limited for operational or business purposes.
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