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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: MX300

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Apr 19, 2022 at 3:29 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, office@vmsecure.me.uk

Hi
Please can we process this order under Viamed. 

The first part listed (0100171 - MX300 rev.1 front case) is no longer available. However, SN has provided an ex-
demo one that Cathy can send FOC. 

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Yamina Duteille <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>

Date: Sat, 16 Apr 2022 at 08:33

Subject: TR: MX300

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>, <viamedinbox@gmail.com>


Dear Ryan,

 

Please find enclosed the PO of parts for MX300 and many thanks for the offered case. 

Please provide me your SO confirmation with the delivery date.

 

Kind regards

 

Yamina

 

 

 

 

 

Cordiales salutations
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Yamina DUTEILLE

 

ANAGAZ

2 Rue Des Pensées

91 600 Savigny Sur Orge

Tél : + 00 (33) (0) 6 41 60 35 13

Fax : + 00 (33) (0) 1 70 24 73 84

 

 

 

De : Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] De la part de Ryan Swaine

Envoyé : jeudi 7 avril 2022 15:45

À : Yamina Duteille <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>

Objet : Re: MX300

 

Hi Yamina

 

We are lucky, we have managed to find a rev.1 case for you, this will avoid a more expensive upgrade. Please see
attached picture. I am quite happy to give you this free of charge. 

 

You will still need to purchase the battery door and the sensor cable:

 

Battery door - 0121211 = EUR €4.80

Sensor cable - 0131202 = EUR €19.20

Both parts are available from stock.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

https://www.google.com/maps/search/2+Rue+Des+Pens%C3%A9es+91?entry=gmail&source=g
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On Thu, 31 Mar 2022 at 13:07, Yamina Duteille <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> wrote:

Ryan,

 

The parts to be replaced are :

 

The front display

battery receptacle cover

oxygen cell connection cable

 

thank you in advance to let me know

 

kind regards

 

Yamina

 

 

Cordiales salutations

 

 

Yamina DUTEILLE

 

ANAGAZ

2 Rue Des Pensées

91 600 Savigny Sur Orge

Tél : + 00 (33) (0) 6 41 60 35 13

Fax : + 00 (33) (0) 1 70 24 73 84

 

 

 

De : Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] De la part de Ryan Swaine

Envoyé : jeudi 31 mars 2022 13:22

À : Yamina Duteille <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>

Objet : Re: MX300

 

Hi Yamina
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I am sure we can supply you from Viamed with the parts required or conduct the repair for you. Please can you let
me know what you need, the cable looks twisted, but the monitor looks to be working?

 

Best regards

Ryan

 




Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Thu, 31 Mar 2022 at 11:40, Yamina Duteille <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

Can we supply the parts (viewed on photos attached) or repair MX300 S/N  279056? Thank you

 

Kind regards

 

Yamina

 

 

 

 

 

Cordiales salutations

 

 

Yamina DUTEILLE

 

ANAGAZ

2 Rue Des Pensées

91 600 Savigny Sur Orge

Tél : + 00 (33) (0) 6 41 60 35 13
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Fax : + 00 (33) (0) 1 70 24 73 84

 

 

 

 

De : .Archet.Biomed Disp Soins Chir. CHU Nice [mailto:BiomedDSC-AR@chu-nice.fr] 

Envoyé : jeudi 31 mars 2022 09:36

À : 'yamina.duteille@anagaz.com' <yamina.duteille@anagaz.com>

Cc : .Archet.Biomed Disp Soins Chir. CHU Nice <BiomedDSC-AR@chu-nice.fr>; KUSY AGNES CHU Nice
<kusy.a@chu-nice.fr>; GIUSTI CHRISTELLE CHU Nice <giusti.c@chu-nice.fr>

Objet : demande de pièces

 

Bonjour Mme Duteille,

 

Suite à notre conversation téléphonique; nous avons un analyseur d’oxygène de marque Télédyne type MX300
n° de série 279056 dont la face avant est à remplacer et sur lequel il manque le capot du réceptacle de pile .

Pouvez- vous me dire si vous avez ces pièces en stock et des câbles de connections pour cellule d’oxygène ?

Si oui, pouvez-vous m’établir un devis ?

En vous remerciant d’avance.

 

Bien à vous.

 

Lionel WERNER– TSH Biomédical

C.H.U de Nice - Hôpital Archet

Direction des achats et de l’ingénierie biomédicale

Département d’ingénierie biomédicale

151 Route Saint Antoine de Ginestière – CS 23079

(Niveau -1 via le quai de livraison)

06202 NICE Cedex 3

04.92.03.62.78 – biomeddsc-ar@chu-nice.fr

P Adoptez l'éco-attitude.

N'imprimez ce mail que si c'est vraiment nécessaire.

 

 

 

 

L'absence de virus dans ce courrier électronique a été vérifiée par le logiciel antivirus Avast. 

www.avast.com
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2 attachments
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