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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM130166-1

1 message

helen lamb <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Apr 19, 2022 at 10:49 AM
Reply-To: helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk
To: zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Eldirdiri Osman Ali <eldirdiri@hotmail.com>

Date: Tue, 19 Apr 2022 at 09:59

Subject: Re: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM130166-1

To: accounts@viamed.co.uk <accounts@viamed.co.uk>


Dear Sir or Madam,

I need a repeat order for 2 pieces of R-22MED.

Thanks

DR E Osman Ali

From: accounts@viamed.co.uk <accounts@viamed.co.uk>

Sent: 05 May 2021 10:19

To: eldirdiri@hotmail.com <eldirdiri@hotmail.com>

Subject: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM130166-1
 
Please find attached invoice(s) from Viamed Ltd.


Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us. 

accounts@viamed.co.uk


Regards 

Accounts Department 

Viamed Ltd 

accounts@viamed.co.uk


Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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