07/04/2022, 15:06 Gmail - Fwd: 0110073: Oxygen Sensor # 60859 (2pcs/set) R-22VA

M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: 0110073: Oxygen Sensor # 60859 (2pcs/set) R-22VA

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Thu, Apr 7, 2022 at 2:08 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Please can we send Ayman Mira a proforma invoice with shipping charges.
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: AL MIRA CENTRE <medical@almiracentre.com>

Date: Thu, 7 Apr 2022 at 13:21

Subject: Re: 0110073: Oxygen Sensor # 60859 (2pcs/set) R-22VA
To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Mr. Ryan Swaine,
Thanks for your prompt reply.

We would like to know the exact freight charge for below quantity to JEDDAH, So please send
us a Pro-forma.

R-22VA - 0110073 (pack of 2) = USD $80 each EXW.........cccceevrurrvreenns 04 Packs
Awaiting your prompt reply soon
Thanks and best regards,

Engr. AYMAN J. MIRA
Dy. General Manager-Medical Div.

AL-MIRA CENTRE FOR TRAD. CO. LTD,.
POST BOX NO: 2120, DAMMAM - 31451,
SAUDI ARABIA.

Phone : +966 3 827 3792 Extn: 260

Fax :+966 3 8276 071/ 8270 320
E-mail : medical@almiracentre.com

Website: www.almiracentre.com

From: Ryan Swaine

Sent: Thursday, 07 April, 2022 2:44 PM

To: AL MIRA CENTRE

Subject: Re: 0110073: Oxygen Sensor # 60859 (2pcs/set) R-22VA
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07/04/2022, 15:06 Gmail - Fwd: 0110073: Oxygen Sensor # 60859 (2pcs/set) R-22VA
Dear Engr. Ayman

Thank you very much for your email.

We would be very happy to quote you for your R-22VA sensors, but please note that we do not have any SFDA
registration!

R-22VA - 0110073 (pack of 2) = USD $80 each EXW
R-22VA - 0110039 (single sensor) = USD $40 each EXW

I look forward to hearing from you and please never hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 7 Apr 2022 at 12:14, AL MIRA CENTRE <medical@almiracentre.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

SUB:- Atom Infant Incubator Model Dual Incu i

Please quote us your best price and earliest possible delivery time with the shipping cost for
the following item.

0110073: Oxygen Sensor # 60859 (2pcs/set) R-22VA.........cccevveviinennne. 04pcs.
Awaiting your prompt reply soon
Thanks and best regards,

Engr. AYMAN J. MIRA
Dy. General Manager-Medical Div.

AL-MIRA CENTRE FOR TRAD. CO. LTD,.
POST BOX NO: 2120, DAMMAM - 31451,
SAUDI ARABIA.

Phone : +966 3 827 3792 Extn: 260

Fax :+966 3 8276 071/ 8270 320
E-mail : medical@almiracentre.com

Website: www.almiracentre.com
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