05/04/2022, 15:01 Gmail - RE: R-17MED Quote

M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: R-17MED Quote

1 message

MCMAHON Susie <Susie. MCMAHON@trescal.com> 5 April 2022 at 14:58
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good Afternoon Kate

With regards to the quote below can you please forward a proforma invoice to myself and | will arrange to have
this paid by credit card to enable us to order this part. Thanks

o
Safe

Susie McMahon

CSR

Trescal

Trescal Ltd

Tel: +44 (0) 1383 646500 | Mobile: +44 (0)

Email: Susie.mcmahon@trescal.com

Address: Trescal Ltd, Muirton Way, Donibristle Ind. Estate, Dalgety Bay, Fife, KY11 9FZ,
UK

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 28 March 2022 11:36

To: Collett Paul <paul.collett@trescal.com>

Subject: Re: R-17MED Quote

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the company. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.
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Good morning Paul,

Thank you for your email.

The price breaks for part number 0110017 - R-17MED are as follows:

1=£42.00 2 = £ 40.00 each 3-10 = £ 38.00 each 11 or more = £ 36.00 each

Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors, all prices are exclusive of VAT. This item is currently in stock.

If you require a proforma invoice, please let me know.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 28 Mar 2022 at 11:22, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Collett Paul <paul.collett@trescal.com>
Date: Mon, 28 Mar 2022 at 11:11

Subject: R-17MED Quote

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,

Please can you quote me for a R-17MED oxygen sensor P/N: 0110017. Please indicate carriage and any lead
time. Thank you for your help.

Regards,

Paul Collett.

Paul Collett

TreSCal Trescal Limited

Tel: +44 (0) 1493 440600

Email: Paul.Collett@Trescal.com
Address: Trescal Limited, Unit 12 Hewett Road, Gapton Hall Industrial Estate,
Great Yarmouth, Norfolk, NR31 ONN, United Kingdom.

P Please don't print this e-mail unless you really need to.

NOTICE — This communication may contain confidential and privileged information that is for the sole use of the intended recipient. Any viewing,
copying or distribution of, or reliance on this message by unintended recipients is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
notify us immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Even though Trescal is careful to ensure the security of the e-
mail sent, the detection of malicious software does not fall under Trescal’s responsibility, so check the e-mail carefully. Moreover, the sender of this
email is fully responsible for its content, and Trescal refuses to take any liability for potential damages. Is it absolutely necessary to print this email?
We care about environment and every unprinted e-mail keeps the environment protected and forested.
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NOTICE — This communication may contain confidential and privileged information that is for the sole use of the intended recipient. Any viewing, copying
or distribution of, or reliance on this message by unintended recipients is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify us
immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. Even though Trescal is careful to ensure the security of the e-mail sent, the
detection of malicious software does not fall under Trescal’s responsibility, so check the e-mail carefully. Moreover, the sender of this email is fully
responsible for its content, and Trescal refuses to take any liability for potential damages. Is it absolutely necessary to print this email? We care about
environment and every unprinted e-mail keeps the environment protected and forested.
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