03/04/2022, 15:22 Gmail - Fwd: IMTC ORDER 2011623

M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: IMTC ORDER 2011623

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 3 April 2022 at 15:19
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Ayelet Mor <Ayelet@imtc.co.il>

Date: Sun, 3 Apr 2022 at 07:20

Subject: IMTC ORDER 2011623

To: orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Good morning,

Pls find attached our order
Pls send proforma invoice

Send with TNT ACCOUNT NO. 38838

BEST REGARDS,
AYELET

Ayelet Mor

International Medical Trade & Consultants (I.M.T.C.)

Faran 2, Yavne 8122502 P.O.Box 8508 Rishon Le Zion Israel
Tel: 972-08-6636637 fax: 972-08-6767603

ayelet@imtc.co.il
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