01/04/2022, 10:14 Gmail - Fwd: Demande de prix N° DEM22S-0257

M Gma“ Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Demande de prix N°DEM22S-0257

1 message

Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Tue, Mar 29, 2022 at 3:01 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: SAV | SHA Medical <sav@sha-medical.com>
Date: Tue, 29 Mar 2022 at 14:58

Subject: RE: Demande de prix N°DEM22S-0257

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Hello,

Thanks a lot for your answer.
We received an offer on 03/04/2022 (Proforma Invoice VM135784.

Everything is in order for us.

King regards
Cordialement,
Muriel ALLEMAND

SAV /S Maintenance

‘ 04 75 82 12 12 - www.sha-medical.fr

r. Z8 de Fiancey - 335 rue des entrepreneurs
MEDIEA

L 26250 Livron-sur-Drome

Ce message et toutes les piéces jointes sont confidentiels et établis a I'intention exclusive de son ou ses destinataires.
Si vous avez regu ce message par erreur, merci d'en avertirimmédiatement I'émetteur et de détruire le message.
Toute modification, édition, utilisation ou diffusion non autorisée est interdite.

L'émetteur décline toute responsabilité au titre de ce message s'il a été modifié, déformé, falsifié, infecté par un virus ou encore édité ou diffusé
sans autorisation.

Afin de contribuer au respect de I'environnement, merci de n'imprimer ce mail qu'en cas de néces
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De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Sophie Lines
Envoyé : mardi 29 mars 2022 11:56

A : SHA Medical <contact@sha-medical.com>

Objet : Re: Demande de prix N°'DEM22S-0257

Dear Muiriel,

| am just following up the below - please can you let me know if this order/proforma is still required?

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 12:50 PM Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Muriel,

Thank you for your email.

Please be aware that part number 0012160 (Pulse Oximeter Viamed VM 2160) has now been discontinued, and
replaced with the following product:

0012165 - Pulse Oximeter Viamed VM-2160 SMARTsat.

Please find your Proforma Invoice attached for 1x unit - if another of the SpO2 sensors is preferred, instead of part
number 0014752, please let me know and | will amend this for you.

If you have any questions please do not hesitate to contact me.
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Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 7:00 AM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: SHA Medical <contact@sha-medical.com>
Date: Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 09:47

Subject: Demande de prix N°DEM22S-0257

To: VIAMED LTD (facturation) <info@viamed.co.uk>

Bonjour,
Veuillez trouver en piéce-jointe notre Demande de prix n° DEM22S-0257.
Restant a votre disposition pour tout renseignement supplémentaire.

Cordialement,
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