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M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Ready to place my order - but would like to get a modified proforma
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 29 March 2022 at 14:48
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Gerold Diessenbacher, MediTrade GmbH <gd@meditrade.org>

Date: Tue, 29 Mar 2022 at 14:47

Subject: Ready to place my order - but would like to get a modified proforma

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Dear Sophie,

OK, | am ready to place my order. Your attached proforma looks almost perfect — except one point: please delete the
Euro 3.—for insurance! Transport insurance is generally covered by ourselves.

As soon as | have your new proforma on hand | will release the payment. When the payment was done | will drop you
my purchase order and a copy of the prepayment voucher.

Does that sound OK?
Thank you so much.

Kind Regards,
Gerold Diessenbacher
MediTrade-Oyten/Germany

Tel: +49-4207-9175-0
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