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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Please quote me for five each #0110420 MAX-14 (Fluke) O2 Sensors

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Mar 28, 2022 at 9:28 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal
<zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Please can we provide a proforma invoice for the 5x MAX14 sensors, including UPS. Distributor EUR pricing.

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Gerold Diessenbacher, MediTrade GmbH <gd@meditrade.org>

Date: Fri, 25 Mar 2022 at 13:55

Subject: Please quote me for five each #0110420 MAX-14 (Fluke) O2 Sensors

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>


Hello Ryan,

 

Are you still there?

 

Could you please quote me for five each #0110420 MAX-14 Sensors for use with Fluke monitors.

 

Please add shipping costs. Customs clearance and handling will be paid for at this end.

 

Thank you so much for helping me out.

 

Best Regards,

Gerold Diessenbacher

MediTrade-Oyten/Germany = Acc.-Nbr. 00006336

 

Tel: +49-4207-9175-0

gd@meditrade.org

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:gd@meditrade.org
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:gd@meditrade.org

