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M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Shipment of UFO sensors
1 message

Apostolos Atsalakis <apostolos@pnoe.com> 22 March 2022 at 12:27

To: Dimitrios Charalambidis <dimitrios.charalambidis@pnoe.com>
Cc: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>, Apostolos Atsalakis
<apostolos@endomedical.co>, Anastasia Paraskevopoulou <anastasia.paraskevopoulou@pnoe.com>

Hi Steve, can we please arrange the shipment of the 15 or 16 sensors today as Friday is a bank holiday in Greece
and customs will be closed.

Regards,

Apostolos

Apostolos Atsalakis | Co-founder & CRO
apostolos@pnoe.com / +1 650 670 4570 (US) / +30 693 660 9908 (GR)

2345 Yale Street
Palo Alto | California | 94306
https://www.pnoe.com

00600
On Tue, Mar 22, 2022 at 2:15 PM Dimitrios Charalambidis <dimitrios.charalambidis@pnoe.com> wrote:
Hi Steve,

Thank you for your email. It seems that our Bank rejected the expedited payment. Attached you will find the new
proof of payment. | am sorry for the inconvenience.

Best regards,
D.

Dimitrios Charalambidis
Head of Operations | ENDO Medical, Inc & XHALE SA | https://pnoe.com

DNIOE

PNOE DISCLAIMER The Information in this email is intended for educational purposes only and is not intended
to diagnose or treat any health condition or illness.

On Tue, Mar 22, 2022 at 2:02 PM Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Dimitrios

Can you please confirm that the payment was transferred, as so far we haven't received it.

Steve

On Wed, 16 Mar 2022 at 11:36, Dimitrios Charalambidis <dimitrios.charalambidis@pnoe.com> wrote:
Hi again Sarah,

Attached you will find the proof of payment. This transaction will be executed today.

| remain at your disposal for any further information or assistance.
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Best regards,

D.

Dimitrios Charalambidis
Head of Operations | ENDO Medical, Inc & XHALE SA | https://pnoe.com

DNIOE

PNOE DISCLAIMER The Information in this email is intended for educational purposes only and is not
intended to diagnose or treat any health condition or illness.

On Wed, Mar 16, 2022 at 1:23 PM Dimitrios Charalambidis <dimitrios.charalambidis@pnoe.com> wrote:
Hi Sarah,

Thank you for your email. This will be paid today. | will share a proof of payment right away. Please proceed
with the shipment and | will get back to you shortly.

Best regards,
D.

Dimitrios Charalambidis
Head of Operations | ENDO Medical, Inc & XHALE SA | https://pnoe.com

DNIOE

PNOE DISCLAIMER The Information in this email is intended for educational purposes only and is not
intended to diagnose or treat any health condition or illness.

On Wed, Mar 16, 2022 at 1:05 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Dimitrios,

Please can you advise when payment will be made for the 11 x UFO sensors that we have in stock for
you?

| have attached a copy of the proforma for your reference.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

Steve Nixon
Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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