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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order FM144052

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 March 2022 at 13:44
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Cavanagh Kara-Jane (BFWML) <Kara-Jane.Cavanagh@bfwml.co.uk>

Date: Wed, 16 Mar 2022 at 13:43

Subject: RE: Order FM144052

To: Bailey David (BFWML) <David.Bailey@bfwml.co.uk>

Cc: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>


Hi Dave,

 

This order has now been cancelled.

 

Regards,

 

Kara Cavanagh

Procurement Coordinator

Kara-Jane.Cavanagh@bfwml.co.uk

T:
01253 956862

W: www.bfwml.co.uk

 

I am unable to give payment dates.  For all payment related queries, please
contact
BFWMPayables@bfwml.co.uk
or telephone
01253 957927

 

 

 

 

Atlas BFW Management Ltd., Ainscoe House, 12 East Park Drive, Blackpool, FY3 8DX.
Company Number:
10525158 VAT Number: 264 7418 84
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**************************************************************************************************************************************************

The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential, may be privileged, may be subject to copyright and are
intended solely
for the use of the individual, or individuals to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email and
you are not the intended recipient, or have received this in error, please notify the sender / BFW Management Ltd. (Atlas) and
delete this email from
your mailbox and any other storage media. Atlas does not accept liability for any statements made
which are clearly the sender's own and not expressly made by, or on behalf of Atlas. Disclosing, copying, distributing, or taking
any action in reliance on the
contents of this email are strictly prohibited.

 

This document has been scanned for viruses, however we cannot rule out the possibility that the contents of any attachment
to this e-mail
may contain software viruses, which could damage your own computer system. Atlas does not accept liability for
any loss or damage, which you sustain as a result of software viruses. You should carry out your own virus checks before
opening the attachment.

 

 

 

From: Bailey David (BFWML) <David.Bailey@bfwml.co.uk>


Sent: 16 March 2022 13:18

To: Cavanagh Kara-Jane (BFWML) <Kara-Jane.Cavanagh@bfwml.co.uk>

Subject: Order FM144052

 

Hi Kara,

Please can you cancel order FM144052 ( Viamed ), due to price increase. I will submit a new order.

Many thanks.

 

David Bailey

Medical Engineering Support Worker

T:
01253 951574

W: www.bfwml.co.uk

 

 

 

Atlas - BFW Management Ltd., Ainscoe House, 12 East Park Drive, Blackpool, FY3 8DX.
Company Number:
10525158 VAT Number: 264 7418 84
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