
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor

1 message

Scubadive West <info@scubadivewest.com> 14 March 2022 at 11:16
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan
Thanks for the quick reply. We will take two sensors please. 
Our details are as follows
Scubadive Ltd
VAT No. 1409814i
EORI No. IE1409814i
Delivery and invoice address 
Scubadive West
Renvyle
Co. Galway
Ireland
H91 W938
Best regards
Cillian

On Mon 14 Mar 2022 at 10:41, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Cilian


Thank you for your email. 


The sensor you require is our R-22SHO and we have them available from stock in our UK warehouse. We would
be happy to extend to you our trade pricing as follows:


R-22SHO = GBP £35
Postage = GBP £11
Total = GBP £46


If you would like to proceed with an order, please can you supply us with your complete delivery and invoice
address (if different). Please can you supply your company EORI and or a VAT number if you have one, it will help
with your importation.
Payment can be made by bank transfer or most major credit.debit cards.


I look forward to hearing from you and please let me know if you have any questions.


Best regards
Ryan




Ryan Swaine
General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117




On Mon, 14 Mar 2022 at 10:12, Scubadive West <info@scubadivewest.com> wrote:


mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:info@scubadivewest.com


Good morning
I was pointed in your direction by Mike from Undersea. I have an old Alpha-1 O2 analyser which he supplied that
needs a replacement sensor. 
Could you please advise if you can supply these?


Many thanks
Cillian
-- 

Best Regards 

Cillian
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