14/03/2022, 10:03 Gmail - Re: Purchase Order 0030 - OCI 3662

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: Purchase Order 0030 - OCI 3662

1 message

Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> Mon, Mar 14, 2022 at 10:00 AM

Reply-To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
To: Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

Dear Berenice

I can confirm we have received your payment and your order is now ready for collection by your DHL courier - the
dimensions of the parcel are:

36 x 36 x25 cm
3.2 kg

Please can you confirm the delivery address should appear as follows?

Medix Medical Devices SRL
Jean Mermoz 1750

El Talar, Tigre (B1618EWC)
Buenos Aires

Argentina

If any changes are required, please let me know.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, Mar 11, 2022 at 5:56 PM Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Dear Zoey,

Please confirm us when you recieve the payment, and we coordinate the delivery by DHL Courier.
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We are waiting your answer.
Thanks

Regards

medgdiX

METICAL DEVICES

Berenice Bajo | Analista SR
berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar
+54 11 5295-2747 TELEFONO | +54 9 11 CELULAR

medix.com.ar

ol

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Betina Falcon <betina.falcon@medix.com.ar>

Enviado el: viernes, 11 de marzo de 2022 10:34

Para: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>; zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

CC: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>; Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: RE: Purchase Order 0030 - OCI 3662

Adding OCI number on the subject.

mediX

MEGICAL BEVICES

BETINA FALCON | Jefe de Comercio Exterior.
Betina.falcon@medix.com.ar

+54 11 5295-2747 | +54 9 11 3490 9444
medix.com.ar

ol

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui
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De: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

Enviado el: jueves, 10 de marzo de 2022 17:01

Para: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

CC: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>; Betina Falcon <betina.falcon@medix.com.ar>; Berenice Bajo
<berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: RE: Purchase Order 0030

Dear Zoey,

The invoice address is ok. We have already payed the invoice.

Everything regarding to the shipment, you can ask to Betina and Berenice.

Best regards!

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Zoey Teal

Enviado el: jueves, 10 de marzo de 2022 05:07

Para: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

CC: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>; Betina Falcon <betina.falcon@medix.com.ar>; Berenice Bajo
<berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: Purchase Order 0030

Dear Gonzalo,

Please accept my reply.

Can you please confirm if the invoice address should be:
Xidem

2330 Ponce de Leon BLVD

Coral Gables Florida

FL 33134

USA

Please can you also confirm the courier you will be using as | will need to confirm this for your proforma?

We do have stock currently available so we wil be able to ship in 2-3 working days after the payment have
reached our bank.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards
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Zoey Teal
Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still
be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

Date: Wed, 9 Mar 2022 at 19:52

Subject: RE: Purchase Order 0030

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Cc: Betina Falcon <betina.falcon@medix.com.ar>, Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

Dear Sophie,
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| will make the payment from Xidem, but the Shipping adress continues the same with Medix.

Betina and Berenice will give you al the Shipping information you need.

Can you tell me if the goods will be ready to deliver once we pay?

Best regards!

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sophie Lines
Enviado el: viernes, 4 de marzo de 2022 10:24

Para: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: Re: Purchase Order 0030

Dear Gonzalo,

Thank you for your order. Please find attached your Proforma Invoice - | have used the address as shown on
your purchase order, however this is different from the last address we used for you - please can you let me
know if this is correct?

| have used EXW, however if you would like us to work out the cost of delivery using our UPS courier, please let
me know and | will add this information for you.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited
and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call
+44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 11:48 AM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi

Please can we send Gonzalo a proforma invoice. Invoice account would be Xidem CID18946 and delivery
address would be Medix (same as RVM133012-1)

Thank you

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

Date: Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 20:47

Subject: Purchase Order 0030

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Betina Falcon <betina.falcon@medix.com.ar>, Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>

Dear Ryan,

Please see attached the purchase order 0030.

As soon as you send me the invoice i can make the payment.

As the last purchase, i will pay from the company XIDEM, but the delivery remains with Medix Argentina.

Best regards!

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine
Enviado el: miércoles, 16 de febrero de 2022 12:59

Para: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: Re: Request For Quotation
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Dear Gonzalo

Thank you very much for your email.

R-17MED - part no. 0110017 = USD $34.50 each EXW

46x sensors are currently available from stock

Please let me know if you wish to proceed and | will organise a proforma invoice for you. Our bank details will
be listed on your proforma and we would dispatch your sensors as soon as payment is received.

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Gmail - Re: Purchase Order 0030 - OCI 3662

On Wed, 16 Feb 2022 at 15:02, Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Dears,

Hope you are doing well.

We need your best quotation for the following item:

N° componente | Text

Quantity

0110017 Teledyne Oxygen Sensor R-17MED

46

As soon as you quote, we are willing to place the P.O —Please confirm availability as well.

Could you please confirm and comment about payment?

Awaiting your early response.

Best Regards!
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