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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Purchase Order Number: 128065

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 11 March 2022 at 10:04
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <Chrystal_Consulting@ingenicasolutions.com>

Date: Fri, 11 Mar 2022 at 10:02

Subject: Purchase Order Number: 128065

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>


FAO: Viamed Ltd

Please find attached our Purchase Order Number: 128065.

This is an automated email that cannot accept replies.

Please contact

orders@chrystalconsulting.co.uk with any order queries and order confirmation.

Please send all invoices and statements to

 

finance@chrystalconsulting.co.uk 

Kind regards

 

Chrystal Consulting Limited

500 Styal Road

Manchester

M22 5HQ

Office 0161 493 9770

Purchase-Order 128065.pdf

344K

mailto:Chrystal_Consulting@ingenicasolutions.com
mailto:sales@viamed.co.uk
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=97ca69e8f6&view=att&th=17f78705d794eb1b&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=17f786faff645c566ba1&safe=1&zw

