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On Thu, Jun 24, 2021 at 1:39 PM Alex Basilashvili <a29basco@hotmail.com> wrote:

Hello,

Usually, we pay all charges when making a payment, it means you get 100% of your mo
You will be charged only if you do withdrawal cash from ATM
So, please send me new invoice.
Regards Alex



From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk
Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 6:46 PM

To: Alex Basilashvili <a29basco@hotmail.com>

Subject: Re: Teledyne R-22A & R-22AV
 
Dear Alex, 


Bank charges are the charges we incur when we receive money from you. These can be quite larg


If you can guarantee that you will pay All Charges when making a payment we can waive these an
your order.




Alex Basilashvili 
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