10/03/2022, 11:43 Gmail - Re: Proforma Invoice

M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma Invoice
1 message

Crystal Technology <ctsirajul@gmail.com> 10 March 2022 at 11:32
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Hello!

Thank you for your prompt response.

Please be informed that the insurance shall be covered from our end. So discard the insurance from the Proforma
invoice. Also add a couple of sensors (i.e 12 units instead of 10 units).

The proforma invoice to be duly signed.

Provide the HS code also.

Looking forward.

Kind regards.

Sirajul Islam
Crystal Technology

Kazi Alauddin Road. Dhaka-1000. Bangladesh

Tel.: +880-2-47116493, 47114782.

Cell.: +880 1819 214076, +880 1923 208765

Skype: crystalbangladesh WhatsApp: +8801819214076.

On Thu, Mar 10, 2022 at 4:30 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon,

Please accept my reply as Lisa has not worked for Viamed for approximately 6 years now.
Thank you for your email.

| have attached a proforma invoice for your reference. We do not have a free stock and the lead time would be
approximately 6 weeks from receipt of payment. | have also attached our bank details for your reference.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Crystal Technology <ctsirajul@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, 10 Mar 2022 at 09:42

Subject: Proforma Invoice

To: Lisa Leggoe <lisa.leggoe@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Lisa,
Please send us a Pro-forma Invoice for 10 units of 02 cell ( R-22A Oxygen Sensor) Part no. 0110122.
Looking forward to hearing from you

Kind regards.

Sirajul Islam
Crystal Technology

Kazi Alauddin Road. Dhaka-1000. Bangladesh

Tel.: +880-2-47116493, 47114782.

Cell.: +880 1819 214076, +880 1923 208765

Skype: crystalbangladesh WhatsApp: +8801819214076.
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