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M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: New purchase order
1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 7 March 2022 at 13:32

Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vandagraphst.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Nicky Finn <nicky@apdiving.com>

Date: Fri, 4 Mar 2022 at 11:46

Subject: RE: New purchase order

To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Hi Steve,

Thanks for the reply. | understand and thanks for the explanation, | understand the need for us to be in the correct
price band. Attached is an amended PO.

Martin and | are off to France next week for the Paris dive show, first show in 2 years so it will feel a bit strange!
Take care.

Best regards,

Nicky

Nicola Finn
Inspiration Product Manager

AP Diving

I built for adventure

W: www.apdiving.com

E: nicky@apdiving.com
T: +44 (0)1326 563834
F: +44 (0)1326 565945
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the trading name of Ambient Pressure Diving Ltd, registered in England under Company Registration Number 4118978, and the
Registered Office is Unit 2C, Water-ma-Trout Industrial Estate, Helston, Cornwall TR13 OLW.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Steve Nixon
Sent: 03 March 2022 17:45

To: Nicky Finn <nicky@apdiving.com>

Subject: Re: New purchase order

Thanks Nicky

The prices haven't changed from the original price list, it is just that we need to use the correct price band. | should
have discussed this with you beforehand.

| hope you are all well and best wishes for the 2022 exhibitions...

Steve

On Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 17:19, Nicky Finn <nicky@apdiving.com> wrote:

Hi Steve,

Many thanks for the reply. Completely understand the price increase as we are aware that all costs are increasing
and we appreciate that you have maintained our prices for a long while.

Now that we are aware that there is a price increase we will amend the PO to show the correct price as Sarah
requested.

Best regards,

Nicky

Nicola Finn
Inspiration Product Manager

AP Diving
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Steve Nixon
Sent: 03 March 2022 16:26

To: Nicky Finn <nicky@apdiving.com>

Subject: Re: New purchase order

Sorry, | forgot to attach the price list.

Steve

On Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 16:22, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com> wrote:

Hi Nicky

If I may, I'll reply on behalf of Sarah.

Our prices have been stable since APD started purchasing back in 2014, as you will appreciate this is a very
long time. We have always had pricing based on order size, see attached price list. We did overlook this with
APD due to Martin's view in regard to annual quantities, but they have reduced year-on-year . In addition, we do
need to bring the processing of the APD orders into line with our ISO procedures...

I'll be reviewing all prices soon, as you know there have been significant general increases in costs. In regard to
your next price list I'll remove the APD8 as previously discussed and in line with the historic purchase order
quantities | suggest we remove the following price bands for the APD16:

1-49
500 - 999

1,000+

Regards
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Steve

On Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 15:56, Nicky Finn <nicky@apdiving.com> wrote:
Hi Sarah,

Thanks for the reply, | am fine thank you.

You mention a price of £29.00, we were not aware of this price rise so could not put it on the PO, you also
mention orders need to be processed as per the order size, this implies that varying quantities attract varying
prices, please can you advise on this?

Cell with serial number APD119677 can be disposed of, many thanks.

Best regards,

Nicky

Nicola Finn
Inspiration Product Manager

AP Diving

I built for adventure

W: www.apdiving.com

E: nicky@apdiving.com
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: 03 March 2022 15:36

To: Nicky Finn <nicky@apdiving.com>

Subject: Re: New purchase order

Dear Nicky,

| am very well thank you. Hope that you are too.

Thank you for your new order.

The unit price on the PO should be £29.00. Orders need to be processed as per the order size and in line
with price list and 1SO.

We received a sensor - S/N: APD119677 that was returned to us. We can either return it to you or dispose of
it on your behalf?

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
http://www.vandagraphst.com/

Email sarah.walton@vandagraphst.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 03116432.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

On Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 14:33, Nicky Finn <nicky@apdiving.com> wrote:

Dear Sarah,
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| hope you are well.

Please find attached a new purchase order for APD16 cells, please can you advise me of the expected
delivery date for these?

Thanks in advance.

Best regards,

Nicky

Nicola Finn
Inspiration Product Manager

AP Diving

| built for adventure

W: www.apdiving.com

E: nicky@apdiving.com
T: +44 (0)1326 563834
F: +44 (0)1326 565945
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If you have received this transmission in error, please use the reply function to tell us and then permanently delete
what you have received. AP Diving is the trading name of Ambient Pressure Diving Ltd, registered in England under
Company Registration Number 4118978, and the Registered Office is Unit 2C, Water-ma-Trout Industrial Estate,
Helston, Cornwall TR13 OLW.

Steve

Steve Nixon

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1726289534603591849%7Cmsg-f%3A1726648139... 6/8


http://www.apdiving.com/
mailto:nicky@apdiving.com

07/03/2022, 13:36 Gmail - Fwd: New purchase order
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

Steve
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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