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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Purchase Order 0030

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Mar 4, 2022 at 11:47 AM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal
<zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi

Please can we send Gonzalo a proforma invoice. Invoice account would be Xidem CID18946 and delivery address
would be Medix (same as RVM133012-1)

Thank you
Ryan


Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

Date: Thu, 3 Mar 2022 at 20:47

Subject: Purchase Order 0030

To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Betina Falcon <betina.falcon@medix.com.ar>, Berenice Bajo <berenice.bajo@medix.com.ar>


Dear Ryan,

 

Please see attached the purchase order 0030.

 

As soon as you send me the invoice i can make the payment.

 

As the last purchase, i will pay from the company XIDEM, but the delivery remains with Medix Argentina.

 

Best regards!

 

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: miércoles, 16 de febrero de 2022 12:59
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Para: Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: Re: Request For Quotation

 

Dear Gonzalo

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

R-17MED - part no. 0110017 = USD $34.50 each EXW

46x sensors are currently available from stock

 

Please let me know if you wish to proceed and I will organise a proforma invoice for you. Our bank details will be
listed on your proforma and we would dispatch your sensors as soon as payment is received.

 

Please do not hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

 

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

 

 

On Wed, 16 Feb 2022 at 15:02, Gonzalo Festa <Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Dears,

Hope you are doing well.

We need your best quotation for the following item:    

Nº componente Text Quantity

0110017 Teledyne Oxygen Sensor R-17MED 46

 

As soon as you quote, we are willing to place the P.O –Please confirm availability as well.

Could you please confirm and comment about payment?

Awaiting your early response.

Best Regards!

mailto:Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:Gonzalo.Festa@medix.com.ar


04/03/2022, 12:35 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase Order 0030

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1726369754940335147%7Cmsg-f%3A172636975… 3/3

 

0001-00000030.pdf

497K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=d104de5290&view=att&th=17f54c253a32642b&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=17f54bee21e22c31e2d1&safe=1&zw

