28/02/2022, 15:03 Gmail - RE: Quote for 0110017 R-17MED oxygen sensor

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Quote for 0110017 R-17MED oxygen sensor

1 message

David Dent <ddent@gnresound.com> 28 February 2022 at 14:58
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

Please provide a proforma invoice.
Our delivery and invoice address is,
GN Hearing A/S

Granville Way

Bicester
Oxfordshire
0X26 4JT

Our VAT registration no is 975064986
Best regards,

David Dent | Quality Engineer | M: +44 7827 912 867 | ddent@gnresound.com |

GN Hearing A/S | UKROC | Granvile Way, Bicester, OX26 4JT, United Kingdom | resound.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 24 February 2022 09:09

To: David Dent <ddent@gnresound.com>

Subject: Re: Quote for 0110017 R-17MED oxygen sensor

Good morning David,
Thank you for your email.

The price breaks for part number 0110017 - R-17MED are as follows:

1=£42.00 2 = £ 40.00 each 3-10 = £ 38.00 each 11 or more = £ 36.00 each

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1725631883001172860%7Cmsg-f%3A172601934... 1/3
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Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors.

If you require a proforma invoice, which will show IBAN and SWIFT information, | would need your delivery and
invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

Our VAT registration number is GB287389593. Please could | ask for yours to add to your account?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1725631883001172860%7Cmsg-f%3A172601934... 2/3


https://eur03.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.viamed.co.uk%2F&data=04%7C01%7Cddent%40gnresound.com%7Cd3aae11a28b24db2702208d9f775530d%7C5007a0102aef460aa4935d61927182be%7C0%7C0%7C637812905567034097%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000&sdata=Q2fjG8iWU4IqsKlYr1Amwrg6we%2BsbewqWcbkcQpoTPc%3D&reserved=0
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
https://eur03.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Ftwitter.com%2FViamedLtd&data=04%7C01%7Cddent%40gnresound.com%7Cd3aae11a28b24db2702208d9f775530d%7C5007a0102aef460aa4935d61927182be%7C0%7C0%7C637812905567034097%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000&sdata=FgCznr5JYDBmvCJcIsaGCLzeh702%2FLaTmQXCLyjFlqI%3D&reserved=0
https://eur03.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.viamed.co.uk%2Fpolicy&data=04%7C01%7Cddent%40gnresound.com%7Cd3aae11a28b24db2702208d9f775530d%7C5007a0102aef460aa4935d61927182be%7C0%7C0%7C637812905567034097%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000&sdata=ncYf2qvUi6N4kONbrhvkqXGKrl3Ro9yS0C5gMmrxyOQ%3D&reserved=0

28/02/2022, 15:03 Gmail - RE: Quote for 0110017 R-17MED oxygen sensor
On Thu, 24 Feb 2022 at 08:20, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: David Dent <ddent@gnresound.com>

Date: Thu, 24 Feb 2022 at 08:16

Subject: Quote for 0110017 R-17MED oxygen sensor
To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,

Please can you provide a quote for supply of 1 of 0110017 R-17MED oxygen sensor.

Additionally can you provide your VAT registration and IBAN and SWIFT for payment, thanks.

Best regards,
David Dent | Quality Engineer | M: +44 7827 912 867 | ddent@gnresound.com |

GN Hearing A/S | UKROC | Granvile Way, Bicester, 0X26 4JT, United Kingdom | resound.com

**** GN GROUP NOTICE - AUTOMATICALLY INSERTED**** The information in this e-mail (including
attachments, if any) is considered confidential and is intended only for the recipient(s) listed above. Any review,
use, disclosure, distribution or copying of this e-mail is prohibited except by or on behalf of the intended recipient. If
you have received this email in error, please notify me immediately by reply e-mail, delete this e-mail, and do not
disclose its contents to anyone. Any opinions expressed in this e-mail are those of the individual and not
necessarily the GN group. Thank you, ******xxxsskxesix BDISCLAIMER END Rk
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