24/02/2022, 09:35 Gmail - RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: P/O: 626800-VIAMO1

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: P/O: 626800-VIAMO1

1 message

Natasha Kirkup <NatashaK@seaward.com> 24 February 2022 at 09:23
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

Thank you for advising me. The price is fine please proceed.

Kind regards,
Natasha Kirkup

Expeditor

T: 0191 587 4968

E: Natashak@seaward.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 23 February 2022 17:00

To: Natasha Kirkup <NatashaK@seaward.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: P/O: 626800-VIAMO1

Good afternoon Natasha,

Thank you for your PO. Please could | inform you that the price of part number 0110022 is £38 each when
purchasing three.

Please let me know if you would like me to proceed.

Many thanks.
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24/02/2022, 09:35 Gmail - RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: P/O: 626800-VIAMO1

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 23 Feb 2022 at 16:52, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <natashak@seaward.com>
Date: Wed, 23 Feb 2022 at 16:49
Subject: P/O: 626800-VIAMO1

To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Our Ref: P/O: 626800-VIAMO1
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24/02/2022, 09:35 Gmail - RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: P/O: 626800-VIAMO1
From: natashak@seaward.com

Please find the enclosed document. Please use the below contact information for any queries you may have:
Invoice, Credit Note & Statement Queries - CreditControl@seaward.com

Remittance Advice Queries sent by Seaward - PurchaselLedger@seaward.com

Purchase Order Queries - the Buyer whom the email was sent

Sales Acknowledgement Queries - Sales@seaward.com

Service/Calibrationhouse Acknowledgement Queries - Service@calibrationhouse.com

Please refer to our website at the link below for a copy of our Terms & Conditions:

https://www.seaward.com/gb/terms-conditions/

This email and any files trasmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity
to whom they are addressed.
If you have received this email in error, please notify the system manager.

Seaward Electronic Ltd, Bracken Hill, South West Industrial Estate, Peterlee, County Durham, SR8 2SW, England.
Company Registration: 1266346.

For the sake of the environment, please do not print this email unless you really need to.
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