
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: VN202

1 message

Stuart Clough <clough.sj@gmail.com> 18 February 2022 at 11:27
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Ryan, good morning,
I would like 4 off SFM3300AW flow sensors, but there seems no option to differentiate the types on the webshop.
Can you send me an invoice and I'll transfer payment forthwith.
Also a few questions:

1. Do you have the scale factory for 37% oxygen in nitrogen, would 850ppm carbon dioxide in that mix change
the scale factor?

2. Do you have any standard interface electronics boards? Ideally an analogue output for the 0-250 lpm?  

Thank you very much & best regards,
Stuart.
Shipping and company details:

INFINITO
LIMITED
7,
Martingale Close, Cambridge CB4 3TA, United Kingdom.

Clough.sj@gmail.com
Mobile:  07747161104 Land line 01223 300
963

EORI
N˚: GB 866874069000 VAT N˚: GB 866 874 069 Company Reg N˚: 04980239 England

On Thu, Apr 15, 2021 at 3:42 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Thank you Stuart


I am glad to hear, but let me know if you have queries.


Best regards


Ryan




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117




On Thu, 15 Apr 2021 at 15:31, Stuart Clough <clough.sj@gmail.com> wrote:


Ryan, good afternoon,
The parts arrived and will do the job just fine.
Many thanks for your help.
Very best regards,
Stuart Clough.
Infinito Ltd
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