18/02/2022, 14:41 Gmail - Re: Colin Appleyard cars

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: Colin Appleyard cars

1 message

Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Feb 18, 2022 at 2:40 PM
Reply-To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
To: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>, a.smith3@colinappleyard.com

Hi Jason,

Thank you - yes | will ask my colleague Cathy to give Ashleigh a call for the card payment - it is likely to be Monday
when she gets to this - once the payment has gone through, we will be in touch regarding when your order is ready to
collect.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
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On Fri, Feb 18, 2022 at 2:31 PM Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>

Date: Fri, 18 Feb 2022 at 14:29

Subject: RE: Colin Appleyard cars

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Cc: Ashleigh Smith <a.smith3@colinappleyard.com>

Hi Sophie

Please could you get somebody to ring our accounts and speak to Ashleigh on 01535 606321
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Company credit card is with Ashleigh

Many thanks

Jason

From: Ashleigh Smith <a.smith3@colinappleyard.com>
Sent: 18 February 2022 14:16

To: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>

Subject: RE: Colin Appleyard cars

Yep do you want it going by bank transfer? Credit card would be quicker for us if theyd be able to contact me
directly so | could pay over the phone?

From: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>
Sent: 18 February 2022 14:13

To: Ashleigh Smith <a.smith3@colinappleyard.com>
Subject: FW: Colin Appleyard cars

Hi Ashleigh

Please could you arrange payment for the attachment sensor

Could you let us know when paid so | can arrange collection

Many thanks

Jason

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 18 February 2022 14:08

To: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>

Subject: Re: Colin Appleyard cars

Hi Jason,

Please find attached your Proforma Invoice for 1x R-22AVG unit.

Please can you let me know when you were planning to collect the unit?
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Our bank details appear on the Proforma Invoice - alternatively, we can take a card payment over the phone,
however as we are working remotely, only our warehouse staff have access to the card reader. Therefore, | would
have to ask them to contact you for payment, as it is not always possible for us to contact them via phone, during
their busy times.
Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm
We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
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On Fri, Feb 18, 2022 at 1:11 PM Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com> wrote:
Hi

we will pick it up, please send proforma with ~ Colin Appleyard cars
Hillam road
Canal road
Bradford
Bd2 1QN

Our accounts will ring and pay over the phone or please send bank details

Just one sensor please £46.00+VAT

Many thanks
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Jason

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 18 February 2022 12:47

To: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>

Subject: Re: Colin Appleyard cars

Hi Jason,

Yes no problem - is the delivery and invoice address as it appears in your email? There is a delivery charge
which depends on how many you would like to purchase - if just purchasing 1 unit, the delivery charge is £6.00
plus VAT. Please let me know how many you require?

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
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On Fri, Feb 18, 2022 at 12:44 PM Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com> wrote:

Hi sophie

Thank you for reply, please could you send proforma invoice and does the price include delivery??

Many thanks

Jason

Colin Appleyard cars
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Hilliam road

Canal road
Bradford

BD2 1QN

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 18 February 2022 11:57

To: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>

Subject: Re: Colin Appleyard cars

Dear Jason,

Thank you for your email.

| can confirm we supply an equivalent sensor to the one you have pictured - our part number is 0110182 (R-
22AVG Automotive Oxygen Sensor) and they are £46.00 each (excl VAT). We do have these available in
stock. | have attached our leaflet and a specification sheet for this model.

If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
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On Fri, Feb 18, 2022 at 10:59 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jason Lee <j.lee@colinappleyard.com>

Date: Fri, 18 Feb 2022 at 10:58

Subject: Colin Appleyard cars

To: enquiries@viamed.co.uk <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>

Hi

Please could you tell me if you sell the oxygen sensor in the attachment and if you have them in stock plus
price?

| would like to order if possible

Many thanks

Jason lee

Service manager (Bradford)
Colin Appleyard cars
07768 066340
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