17/02/2022, 15:19 Gmail - Fwd: Medica

M Gma" Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Medica

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 17 February 2022 at 14:56
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths
<kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi,
Please send Sami a proforma invoice:

Company Name: Intermed Evde Bakim Medikal ve Sag. Hiz. Ltd. Sti.

Address: Rasimpasa Mh. Orgeneral Sahap Gurler Cd. No:16 / A, Rihtim / KADIKOY Post Code: 34716 , ISTANBUL
/ TURKIYE

Tax Office: Kadikoy Tax ID: 478 052 9286
T:+490216 348 17 17
4x Ultramax Oxygen Analyser for Oxygen Concentrators - 0111265 = USD $467.50 each

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Intermed Medikal - Impex <impex@intermedmedikal.com.tr>
Date: Thu, 17 Feb 2022 at 14:29

Subject: RE: Medica

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <erkan@intermedmedikal.com.tr>

Dear Ryan,

Hope you are fine.

- Ultramax Oxygen Analyser for Oxygen Concentrators - 0111265 = USD $467.50 — 4 pcs

- Also we need for portable oxygen concentrator Inogen G3 and G5 , we need with reusable sensor.

Could you please also confirm if you have attached sensor, we need around 1000 pcs.

Could you please forward revised Proforma to us, we would like to proceed with the order.
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Thanks and Best Regards

Sami

BV

INTERMED

Hayat Rahat Nefes Aldikca Gozeldir...

Rasimpasa Mh. Orgeneral Sahap Girler Cd. No:16 / A
Rihtim / KADIKOY  TR34716

ISTANBUL / TURKIYE

Tax Office: Kadikoy

Tax ID: 478 052 9286

T:+90 216 348 17 17

F:+90 216 347 05 10

www.intermedmedikal.com.tr

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Wednesday, December 8, 2021 4:40 PM

To: impex@intermedmedikal.com.tr

Cc: erkan@intermedmedikal.com.tr

Subject: Re: Medica

Dear Sami
Thank you very much.

| have attached the pricing for our VM-2160 SMARTsat pulse oximeter. As standard it would be supplied with an adult
silicone sensor, but upon request we can replace the adult sensor with the paediatric sensor at no additional cost.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
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Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 8 Dec 2021 at 12:46, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Intermed Medikal - Impex <impex@intermedmedikal.com.tr>
Date: Wed, 8 Dec 2021 at 12:45

Subject: RE: Medica

To: <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: <erkan@intermedmedikal.com.tr>

Dear Ryan,
Thanks for your kind reply.

Could you please also inform us the price for VM-2160 pediatric oxiemeter.
We will finalize our order accordingly.

Thanks and Best Regards

Sami

W

INTERMED

Hayat Rahat Nefes Aldikga Gozeldir...

Rasimpasa Mh. Orgeneral Sahap Girler Cd. No:16 / A
Rihtim / KADIKOY  TR34716

ISTANBUL / TURKIYE

Tax Office: Kadikoy

Tax ID: 478 052 9286

T:+90 216 348 17 17

F:+90 216 347 0510

www.intermedmedikal.com.tr
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From: Intermed Medikal - Impex [mailto:impex@intermedmedikal.com.tr]
Sent: Friday, December 3, 2021 3:21 PM

To: 'viamedinbox@gmail.com' <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Cc: erkan@intermedmedikal.com.tr

Subject: RE: Medica

Dear Ryan,

It was pleasure to meet you at Medica.

You can use below details for the invoice.
Company Name: Intermed Evde Bakim Medikal ve Sag. Hiz. Ltd. Sti.

Address: Rasimpasa Mh. Orgeneral Sahap Gurler Cd. No:16 / A, Rihtim / KADIKOY Post Code: 34716 ,
ISTANBUL / TURKIYE

Tax Office: Kadikoy Tax ID: 478 052 9286
T:+90216 348 17 17
Could you please also add oxygen analyzer for portable concentrator, we need the one which can be calibrated.

Looking forward for your favorable reply.

Rasimpasa Mh. Orgeneral Sahap Gurler Cd. No:16 / A
Rihtim / KADIKOY  TR34716
ISTANBUL / TURKIYE

T:+490 216 348 17 17

F:+90 216 347 05 10

www.intermedmedikal.com.tr

Thanks and Best Regards

Sami
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INTERMED

Hayal Rahat Nefes Aldikca Gozeldir...

Rasimpasa Mh. Orgeneral Sahap Girler Cd. No:16 / A
Rihtim / KADIKOY  TR34716

ISTANBUL / TURKIYE

Tax Office: Kadikoy

Tax ID: 478 052 9286

T:+90 216 348 17 17

F:+90 216 347 05 10

www.intermedmedikal.com.tr

From: Erkan OZASLAN [mailto:erkan@intermedmedikal.com.tr]
Sent: Friday, December 3, 2021 9:42 AM

To: impex@intermedmedikal.com.tr

Subject: FW: Medica

A

INTERMED

Hayat Rahat Nefes Aldikca Giazeldir...

Rasimpasa Mh. Orgeneral Sahap Girler Cd. No:16 / A
Rihtim / KADIKOY  TR34716
ISTANBUL / TURKIYE

T:+90 216 348 17 17
F:+90 216 347 05 10

www.intermedmedikal.com.tr
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, November 29, 2021 7:39 PM

To: erkan@intermedmedikal.com.tr

Subject: Medica

Dear Erkan

Thank you very much for taking the time to visit us at Medica, it was a pleasure to meet you.

Further to our conversation, please find attached some information relating to our VM-2160 SMARTsat Pulse
Oximeter, Handi+ Oxygen Analyser and the Oxiquant S Oxygen Analyser.

Handi+ Oxygen Analyser - part no. 0111250 = USD $147 each EXW
Oxyquant S Oxygen Analyser - part no. 0111275 = USD $152 each EXW

Ultramax Oxygen Analyser for Oxygen Concentrators - 0111265 = USD $467.50

You mentioned that you would also like to purchase 2x Ultramax Analysers. | will prepare a proforma invoice for
you, but | noticed you have a couple of offices, please can you let me know what we should use as your invoice
address and delivery address?

| look forward to your reply and please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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