
14/02/2022, 10:16 Gmail - Fwd: Payment Method

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=154df70736&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1724732403304374182&simpl=msg-f%3A1724732… 1/2

Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Payment Method
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 14 February 2022 at 10:02
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>, Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <secretaria@unisub-sabadell.org>

Date: Fri, 11 Feb 2022 at 18:14

Subject: RE: Payment Method

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>


Dear Ryan

 

Here you have a requested information

 

billing information

Unió Subaquàtica Sabadell

NIF: G59500975

C. Bosch i Cardellach, 112

08202 – Sabadell

Barcelona – España

 

delivery address

C. Puigvert, 22, esc C, Bjos, 2ª 

08211- Castellar del Valles

 Barcelona- España

 

requested product (1 unit)

Vandagraph R 17 VAN Oxygen Cell

Replacement oxygen sensor from Vandagraph / Teledyne. R-17 VAN.

Replacement O2 cell for Vandagraph VN202 and TEK-OX
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Best regards

 

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: martes, 8 de febrero de 2022 13:58

Para: secretaria@unisub-sabadell.org

Asunto: Payment Method

 

Dear Unisub Sabadell

 

Thank you for your message. Yes, we can accept payment by bank transfer. 

 

Please let me know your billing and delivery address, telephone number, what you require and I can send you a
proforma invoice with our account details.

 

We will arrange dispatch as soon as your payment is received.

 

Please let me know if you have any questions.

 

Kind regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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