
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: New customer message on February 9, 2022 at 18:21

1 message

James Donnellan <equipmentofficer@athlonesubaqua.ie> 10 February 2022 at 12:55
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

 Thanks Ryan,

I'll be paying with Visa debit.

Invoice address (name on CC) is

Geraldine Fogarty
Athlone Sub-Aqua Club,
Tigh na Mara,  

Coosan Road,

Athlone,

Co. Westmeath,
Ireland
N37 XW30


Delivery address is

James Donnellan
Robotics & Drives Services,
Zone C,
Mullingar Business Park,
Co. Westmeath
N91 H725

If you give me a call on +353852758898 when you are ready to take payment I will give you the card details?

Kind regards,
James

On Thu, 10 Feb 2022 at 11:35, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi James


Card payment would be the easiest. We take most cc and debit cards, unfortunately not AMEX.


Before I take payment, please can you send me your delivery address and invoice address if it is different?


Is it for the club or for yourself?


Best regards
Ryan


Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117




On Thu, 10 Feb 2022 at 11:24, James Donnellan <equipmentofficer@athlonesubaqua.ie> wrote:




 Hi Ryan, 



mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:equipmentofficer@athlonesubaqua.ie


Thanks a million for that, that would be great if I could get one of the demo ones off you! No problem paying the
postage! Can you take card payment or what would be easiest for you?


Kind regards,


James




On Thu, 10 Feb 2022, 11:01 Ryan Swaine, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Hi James


Thank you for your message.


Please find the pricing for the TEK-OX box below:


TEK-OX Dry Box = £16
Postage to Ireland (airmail) = £11


If it is of interest to you, I have some ex-demonstration TEK-OX boxes that may have been used for exhibitions
or occasional projects and I would be happy to supply one of these free of charge, although there will still be
the postage cost?


Please let me know if you have any questions or if you would like to proceed with an order  and I will give you
a call for your details. Payment can be made over the phone by credit card.


Kind regards
Ryan




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117




On Wed, 9 Feb 2022 at 18:21, Vandagraph (Shopify) <mailer@shopify.com> wrote:


You received a new message from your online store's contact form.

Name:
James Donnellan

Email:
equipmentofficer@athlonesubaqua.ie

Phone Number:
353852758898

Message:
Hi,


I am looking for a quote for a replacement case for a TEK-OX.


Thank you,


James
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Athlone Sub-Aqua Club

Tigh na Mara  

Brick Island
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Athlone
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athlonesubaqua.ie

Supported by the people of Athlone



This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and
intended solely for the use of the individual or
entity to whom they are
addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify the sender immediately
and delete this email from your system. The views or opinions expressed are those of the author and do not
necessarily reflect the official policy or position of Athlone Sub-Aqua Club.
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