North Middlesex m

University Hospital

NHS Trust

PURCHASE ORDER: NMU332253

Buyer

Partners Procurement Service
Email: helpdesk@nhspps.uk
Magdala Avenue

London, London N19 5NF

03-Feb-2022
07-Feb-2022

Order Date
Delivery Date

Invoice To

Email: nmu-tr.accountspayable@nhs.net
North Middlesex University Hospital NHS Trust
Accounts Payable, Finance Division

Sterling Way, London N18 1QX

Supplier

Viamed Ltd [NMU]
15 Station Road
Cross Hills

Keighley, BD20 7DT
Fax: 01535 635 582

Order Contact

Name: Ali Sofian Kerkache
Phone: 028 887 2582

Fax: 0000 000 0000
ali.kerkache@nhs.net

Delivery

Ali Sofian Kerkache

GSRN:WEBAK2

AU0012 MEMU maintenance-NMJL

RECEIPT AND DELIVERY REFURB - 9URO
North Middlesex University Hospital NHS Trust
Sterling Way

London, N18 1QX

Delivery Information

Payment Information

Order Type: Direct Ship Customer Number: VIAMEDOO
Carrier: Not Selected -Not Selected Payment Terms: Net 30
FOB - Delivery Terms: Not Selected -Not Selected
Comments Requisition Comment: As per e-mail Quote from kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Line Item Type | Item No | Manufacturer No | UOoM |Pack Size|Qty| Unit Price | VAT Type Extended Amt
Description Est VAT
, | Non-Catalogue | 0110017 - R-17MED | 0110017 - R-17MED | Each | 1/Each | 3| £38.00 |NR £114.00
Oxygen sensors part number 0110017 - R-17MED £22.80
, | Non-Catalogue | 0110024 - R-24 MED | 0110024 - R-24 MED | Each | 1/Each | 1| £42.00 |NR 42,00
Oxygen sensor part number 0110024 - R-24 MED £8.40
Total Extended Amount: | £156.00
Total Estimated VAT: £31.20
Estimated Gross Amount:  £187.20

VAT Types
Key | Description Estimated VAT
NR | Non Recoverable £31.20

Terms & Conditions:

Unless specific written terms and conditions are referenced herein, this Purchase Order is subject to the relevant NHS terms and conditions of
purchase [goods or services - purchase order version] as available at:
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/nhs-standard-terms-and-conditions-of-contract-for-the-purchase-of-goods-and-supply-of-services

Attachment:As_per_e-mail_Quote_from_kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Purchase Order: NMU332253

From: PACITTI, Kamal Kaur (NORTH MIDDLESEX UNIVERSITY

HOSPITAL NHS TRUST)

Order Number: NMU332253  03-Feb-2022
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Sent: 01 February 2022 12:39

To: KERKACHE, Ali (NORTH MIDDLESEX UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL
NHS TRUST)

Subject: FW: current price

Importance: High

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Ali,

Can you order 3 of the following oxygen sensors part number 0110017 - R-17MED £38.00 each

Can you order 1 of the following oxygen sensor part number 0110024 - R-24 MED £42.00
The oxygen sensors are from Viamed.

Thank You

Kamal

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 01 February 2022 12:08

To: PACITTI, Kamal Kaur (NORTH MIDDLESEX UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS TRUST)
Subject: Re: current price

Good afternoon Kamal,

Thank you for your email.

The price breaks for part number 0110017 - R-17MED are as follows:

1=£42.00

2 = £ 40.00 each

3-10 = £ 38.00 each

11 or more = £ 36.00 each

The price breaks for part number 0110024 - R-24 MED are as follows:

1=£42.00

2 = £ 40.00 each

3-10 = £ 38.00 each

11 or more = £ 36.00 each

All prices are excluding VAT. Carriage is free for medical oxygen sensors.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will
be answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing
list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 1 Feb 2022 at 11:57, PACITTI, Kamal Kaur (NORTH MIDDLESEX UNIVERSITY
HOSPITAL NHS TRUST) <kamal.pacitti@nhs.net> wrote:
Dear Sales,

Is it possible to get the current price for the following oxygen sensors

Part number

0110017

Product name

R-17MED Oxygen Sensor

Part number

0110024

Product name :

R-24MED Oxygen Sensor

Thank You
&
Kind Regards

Kamal Pacitti

Specialist Clinical Engineer

Clinical Engineering Department | Main building, level -1 | North Middlesex University
Hospital NHS Trust | Sterling Way |

London N18 1QX

Direct line: 020 8887 3790| e: kamal.pacitti@nhs.net |

www.northmid.nhs.uk

Follow us on Twitter @NorthMidNHS

xxxxx *%

This message may contain confidential information. If you are not the
intended recipient please:

i) inform the sender that you have received the message in error before
deleting it; and

ii) do not disclose, copy or distribute information in this e-mail or take
any action in relation to its content (to do so is strictly prohibited and
may be unlawful).

Thank you for your co-operation.

NHSmail is the secure email, collaboration and directory service available

for all NHS staff in England. NHSmail is approved for exchanging patient data
and other sensitive information with NHSmail and other accredited email
services.

For more information and to find out how you can switch visit Joining NHSmail
— NHSmail Support

This message originated from outside of NHSmail. Please do not click links or open attachments unless you

recognise the sender and know the content is safe.
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