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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: PO A/220015 - URGENT!!

1 message

Administración <administracion@prhoinsa.com> 2 February 2022 at 08:36
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
Cc: amelia <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Sarah!

 

We’ve just paid the proforma. I will send you the payment confirmation in a few minutes.

 

Could you please start arranging the order? So that we can have W&D to arrange transport?

 

Thank you,

 

 

Leonor Jiménez

Dpto. Administración 

PRHOINSA

C/ JOSÉ ABASCAL 55, 2ºD

28003 MADRID

Tel: 91 426 17 12

www.prhoinsa.es 

administracion@prhoinsa.com
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sarah Walton

Enviado el: miércoles, 2 de febrero de 2022 9:17

Para: Administración <administracion@prhoinsa.com>

CC: amelia <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>; Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Asunto: Re: PO A/220015 - URGENT!!

 

Dear Leonor,

 

Thank you for your email and new order.

 

Please find attached a proforma invoice.

 

Weight and dimensions are as follows:

1 Box = 1.20kg. 32 x 24 x 16cm.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 2 Feb 2022 at 08:01, Administración <administracion@prhoinsa.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

I’m attaching a new PO, A/220015. Amelia tells me you know the urgency of this matter, that you’ve already talked
about this. Please! send us the proforma invoice so that we can make the payment and pick-up the cells today.

 

THANK YOU!!

 

 

 

Leonor Jiménez

Dpto. Administración 

PRHOINSA

C/ JOSÉ ABASCAL 55, 2ºD

28003 MADRID

Tel: 91 426 17 12

www.prhoinsa.es 

administracion@prhoinsa.com
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