25/01/2022, 11:43 Gmail - Re: R-17MED Oxygen Sensor

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Re: R-17MED Oxygen Sensor

1 message

Kuldeep Singh <kuldeep.tatvainc@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 25, 2022 at 11:22 AM
To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Rohan Mehtani <rohan@marrsis-disha.com>, shveta@marrsis-disha.com, operations@marrsis-disha.com

Hi
Please share Pl in the below name for 5 pcs

Marrsis Disha
Plot No. 244, Sector 68
IMT Faridabad 121004 Haryana India

Regards

On Tue, Jan 25, 2022 at 4:49 PM Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Kuldeep,

Thank you for your email. | can confirm the price quoted by my colleague Zoey is still valid - would you like me to
put together a Quote or Proforma Invoice?

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, Jan 25, 2022 at 8:52 AM Kuldeep Singh <kuldeep.tatvainc@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Zoey

Greetings of the day !!
Hope you are doing well

Please confirm if this price is still valid
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On Thu, Aug 12, 2021 at 2:53 PM Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Kuldeep,

Please accept my reply.

Storage life of Teledyne oxygen sensors: The useful life of a sensor depends upon concentration of oxygen. If
it is left inside the sealed gas barrier bag, its life expectancy should only deteriorate by 1/20th of its in air life
per year. A shelf life of 1-3 years can be expected if sensors are stored correctly. The special gas barrier bag
allows only a negligible amount of oxygen or moisture to pass through. It is not recommended that sensors are
stored longer than absolutely necessary for warranty purposes. Sensors should retain 90% of their useful life
after 24 months in the gas barrier bag.

The best pricing we can offer is our distributor price which is $34.50 each.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: Kuldeep Singh <kuldeep.tatvainc@gmail.com>

Date: Thu, 12 Aug 2021 at 07:34

Subject: Re: R-17MED Oxygen Sensor

To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sophie

Greetings of the day

What is the shelf life of this item and what is the tentative price so that we can decide quantity ?

Regards

On Tue, Aug 10, 2021 at 5:29 PM Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Kuldeep,

Thank you for your interest in our product.
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We do not currently have a distributor in India - we would be happy to supply you. Please let me know
how many R-17MED Oxygen Sensors you are looking for, and | can send you an official quotation or
proforma invoice.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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prohibited and may be unlawful.
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On Tue, Aug 10, 2021 at 8:52 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Kuldeep Singh <kuldeep.tatvainc@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 10 Aug 2021 at 08:41

Subject: R-17MED Oxygen Sensor

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hello
Myself Kuldeep Singh from Tatva Inc Faridabad India
We are interested in your R-17MED Oxygen Sensor.

Do you have any distributor/dealer partner in India ?

Regards

Tatva Inc
Plot No. 244, Sector 68
IMT Faridabad - 121004 (Haryana)

Tatva Inc

Plot No. 244, Sector 68

IMT Faridabad - 121004 (Haryana)
GSTIN: 06AJQPM5286R1Z3
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Tatva Inc

Plot No. 244, Sector 68

IMT Faridabad - 121004 (Haryana)
GSTIN: 06AJQPM5286R1Z3

Tatva Inc

Plot No. 244, Sector 68

IMT Faridabad - 121004 (Haryana)
GSTIN: 06AJQPM5286R1Z3
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