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M Gma" Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: [EXT] Re: Quote request

1 message

Bourdon, Grégory <gregory.bourdon@seca.com> 21 January 2022 at 14:09
To: "sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

can you send me the quotation and do you know the cost that will be requested by UPS for customs fees?

Grégory Bourdon
Technicien maintenance

SeCa
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: Friday, January 21, 2022 11:09 AM

To: Bourdon, Grégory <gregory.bourdon@seca.com>

Subject: [EXT] Re: Quote request

Good morning Gregory,

Thank you for your email. Please see the comments below highlighted in blue.

Can you give me an estimate for these references:

* 15 x R24MED - No stock available. Lead time is approximately 2 - 3 weeks
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¢ 10 x R17MED - Stock available
¢ 5x MAX250E - Stock available

How are customs fees handled? - | have been advised that it is the receiver's responsibility to pay all custom fees
prior to goods being released. UPS will contact you via email for payment etc.

| hope that this information helps.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative
Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Fri, 21 Jan 2022 at 08:16, Bourdon, Grégory <gregory.bourdon@seca.com> wrote:

Hello

Can you give me an estimate for these references:

* 15x R24MED
e 10 x R17MED
» 5x MAX250E

How are customs fees handled?

Cordially
Grégory Bourdon

Technicien maintenance

SeCa

Systémes Médicaux de Mesure
et de Pesée depuis 1840

seca eurl.
3 rue du Bois Chaland

91090 Lisses, France

phone +33 1 60758707
fax +33 1 60759065
e-mail gregory.bourdon@seca.com

www.seca.com
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