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RE: Price for 15 Ultramax O2 Analysers

1 message

Tony Royston <Tony.Royston@medaid.co.uk> 19 January 2022 at 11:46
To: "sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Hello Sarah,

Thanks very much for the quote/proforma. Actually we’ve been talking again to the client and to cut a long story short
we now need 40 of them!!! Please could you re-quote for that quantity? Would you be able to supply them in about
three weeks time?

This is actually going to be phase one of a multi-phase project for this client if the initial phase goes well. We
therefore anticipate further needs of these items perhaps in about six months time.

Kind Regards,

Tony.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: 18 January 2022 15:53

To: Tony Royston <Tony.Royston@medaid.co.uk>

Cc: Tim Beacon <tim@medaid.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Price for 15 Ultramax O2 Analysers

Good afternoon Tony,

Thank you for your new order.

Please find attached a proforma invoice for your reference.

We currently have 20 units in stock, so as soon as payment has been received, we can arrange shipment.
Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1722303763039039721%7Cmsg-f%3A1722383413... 1/3


mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:Tony.Royston@medaid.co.uk
mailto:tim@medaid.co.uk

19/01/2022, 12:01 Gmail - RE: Price for 15 Ultramax O2 Analysers

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 18 Jan 2022 at 14:41, Tony Royston <Tony.Royston@medaid.co.uk> wrote:

Good Afternoon Sarah,

| hope 2022 is going well for you so far; January seems to be rushing by!

Please could you quote for 15 Ultramax units for delivery to our Bedford premises? | anticipate needing them in
the next month or so.

Best Regards,
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(PGCert Tech Management)
Head of Biomedical Engineering

Working Hours Mon-Fri 08:30 to 16:30 UK Local Time
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