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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Proforma invoice

1 message

Paul Shotton <paul@baro2.com> 17 January 2022 at 15:10
To: "office@viamed.co.uk" <office@viamed.co.uk>, "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk" <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>, Debbie Reddin <debbie@baro2.com>

Hello

 

Can we please order 6 Handi + Analysers, 011250 are they still £104.00 each?

 

Also can you please send me a list of common accessories etc for use with the analysers.

 

Regards

 

Paul

 

 

From: Paul Shotton <paul2013@baro2.com>


Sent: 17 January 2022 15:06

To: Paul Shotton <paul@baro2.com>

Subject: Fwd: Proforma invoice

 

Begin forwarded message:

From: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: 16 February 2021 at 11:27:23 GMT

To: Paul Shotton <paul@baro2.com>, steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
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