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M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: JFD Westhill Facility PO 12200214 V080122 Rev1

1 message
Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 17 January 2022 at 10:55
Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: Emma Robertson <erobertson@jfdglobal.com>
Cc: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vandagraphst.com>
Thank you Emma

We will get back to you this week in regard to a delivery time, we will endeavour to meet your delivery requirements.

The 80100050 Sensors are supplied in accordance to:

1) VST Specification Datasheet - 8010050 JFD Ltd. DB200381 Oxygen Sensor V2.0 2019-05-06

The oxygen sensors are produced with specific components that have been analyzed and approved by JFD
in terms of magnetic signature.

We are unable to produce nor test sensors to a specific magnetic signature specification, therefore there is
no warranty in regard to magnetic signature readings.

2) VST Oxygen Sensor OEM Price List - JFD Divex, 2018-07-24
3) VST Payment Terms & Conditions v1.1
4) JFD Terms & Conditions 2018-03-12
JFDG-LEG-TC-001 JFD Standard Terms and Conditions of Purchase Rev03 revi...
Regards

Steve

On Fri, 14 Jan 2022 at 08:25, Emma Robertson <erobertson@)jfdglobal.com> wrote:

Morning Steve,

Apologies, the call off order was set up with the incorrect costs and it's not something we can amend. We have to
manually adjust the PO to the correct price but | forgot to do that this time.

Please see attached amended order.
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Thank you,

Emma

We want to thank you for your continued support during this very challenging situation, COVID-19 health
emergency

Continued government restrictions and limited availability of transportation may continue to cause some delays in
the supply chain and JFD would like to have this information supplied by our vendors proactively

Please continue to provide regular updates to JFD team members you are in contact with

Emma Robertson Supply Chain Graduate

-\__ erobertson@)jfdglobal.com
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Steve Nixon
Sent: 13 January 2022 15:56

To: Emma Robertson <erobertson@jfdglobal.com>

Cc: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vandagraphst.com>

Subject: Re: JFD Westhill Facility PO 12200214 V080122

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organisation. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe

Dear Emma
Thank you for the new purchase order, but under the current conditions we cannot process it.

1) The pricing is again incorrect, it should be £54.00 per sensor. Carriage charge is £9.00 by UPS Standard Service
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We do maintain an emergency stock of 25 sensors for you, so if required we could ship these as part of the same
order at £54.00 each plus £9.00 carriage charge.

2) The delivery terms cannot be met, it is far too short for the production of a bespoke OEM oxygen sensor. We
usually state 4 -6 weeks. However, under the current pandemic situation it is typically 8 weeks.

3) The standard JFD LTD STANDARD TERMS & CONDITIONS OF PURCHASE JFDG-LEG-TC-001 Revision 03
have been supplied to us, rather than the amended version agreed upon with Duncan back in March 2018:

3.1 Currently the sensors are supplied CPT, but looking at item 3.1 it infers that we cover the insurance.
Do you want us to add the UPS insurance at 1% of the invoice total, as stated on the price list? If so,
could you please add it to the purchase orders or I could update the price list JFD has its own
transportation insurance.

3.10 This would be difficult to apply in regard to the sensors and we would deliver goods as per the
specifications. However, this clause is open ended as far as costs are concerned. Clause 3.10 deleted.

8 (8.1 & 8.2) The sensors are a custom device made to your specifications. So, if the product is
supplied as per the specification we can't be expected to accept returns, other than in respect of
warranty claims. Clause 8 deleted.

14.4 & 14.5 Again as the sensors are a custom design we can't be expected to be subject to these
clauses. Clauses 14.4 & 14.5 deleted.

4) The specification is not attached. Although we can only supply to our specifications:

Specification Datasheet - 8010050 JFD Ltd. DB200381 Oxygen Sensor V2.0 6 th May 2019

5) As discussed on previous occasions we cannot offer any guarantees regarding the sensors being non-magnetic.
They are produced with the critical components that have been tested by JFD.

Regards

Steve

On Thu, 13 Jan 2022 at 13:38, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Emma Robertson <erobertson@)jfdglobal.com>

Date: Thu, 13 Jan 2022 at 13:33

Subject: JFD Westhill Facility PO 12200214 V080122

To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Order Acknowledgements to be sent to ** PURCHASEORDERSUK1@JFDGLOBAL.COM ** Order
confirmations may be missed if not sent to the correct address.

Hi,

Please find attached new purchase order 12200214

Notes:

Delivery to: JFD Westhill Facility, Aberdeenshire UK

If a quotation has been provided this will be referenced on the final order page, delivery must occur by
specified dates unless otherwise agreed.

Where there is no quotation, more often due to recent purchase of same part(s), please endeavour to
accommodate the Required Date listed per the order lines, we realise this date may not always be achievable
however all efforts to acknowledge with closest to are greatly appreciated.

Please note Friday Receiving times : 8:00am to 12:30pm

We want to thank you for your continued support during this very challenging situation, COVID-19 health
emergency

Continued government restrictions and limited availability of transportation may continue to cause some delays
in the supply chain and JFD would like to have this information supplied by our vendors proactively

Please continue to provide regular updates to JFD team members you are in contact with

Emma Robertson Supply Chain Graduate

~-

erobertson@jfdglobal.com

JFD
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JFD is the trading name of JFD Ltd. Registered in Scotland, No: SC123684 with Registered office: JFD, Westhill Industrial Estate,
Enterprise Drive, Westhill, Aberdeen, AB326TQ, United Kingdom

This email and any attachments are confidential and may contain proprietary information, some of which may be legally privileged. It
is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are
not the intended recipient, please notify the author immediately by replying to this email, and then delete all copies of the e-mail from

your system. If you are not the intended recipient you must not use, disclose, distribute,
copy, print or rely on this email.

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

Steve

Steve Nixon
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Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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