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M Gma” Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Fwd: Rick/order

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 17 January 2022 at 09:49

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Rick Kirkham <frontierscuba@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, 15 Jan 2022 at 12:29

Subject: Re: Rick/order

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

HI Ryan,

I am in the UK and would like to order the 3 analysers as per your email last year. No problem if the price has
changed, just let me know the new rate. However, shipping will be within the UK to the address as follows so
please adjust the shipping rate and also include VAT.

Can you include a signed VAT refund form for export? Not sure if you can do that, but if you can then | will get the
form stamped at the airport when | return to the Philippines later this month so that | can reclaim the VAT. | would
need to get the package delivered to London on or before January 27.

Order is 2 x R17van and 1 x R22van [for divesoft trimix analyser]

Address for delivery. Richard Kirkham, 35 Parish Gate Drive, Blackfen, Sidcup DA15 8TJ

Cheers

Richard Kirkham

On Tue, 20 Jul 2021 at 21:27, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Rick

Please accept my reply on Jean's behalf.

Please find your quotation attached, | have based the pricing on delivery to China or Hong Kong.
Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 20 Jul 2021 at 14:03, Frontier Scuba <frontierscuba@gmail.com> wrote:
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HI Jean

no rush, as | need to find an address to send to abroad, but could you send me a quote for the following
3 oxygen sensors for Tek Ox
1 oxygen sensor for divesoft trimix analyser - [22S7]
Please quite excl.VAT - probably shipping to either China or HK
Thanks
Rick Kirkham
On 27/11/2018 8:29 pm, Jean Lamb wrote:
Dear Rick,

Please see the 2 proforma invoices. We will need to charge UK VAT on the UK delivery.

Please check the delivery addresses are correct. Should the UK address include a Company
name?

If all are OK | can ship immediately. | will include the invoices with the goods.
Bank details: Barclays bank: sort code 20-78-42 Vandagraph A/C 90903124
Regards

Jean Lamb

Vandagraph

27th Nov18

On Tue, Nov 27, 2018 at 12:22 AM Rick Kirkham <frontierscuba@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Jean

thanks for the invoice and sorry for the slow reply

| will go ahead with the order with a slight change. | need one of the sensors ASAP so can you
send me that separately to my friend's London address please, He will hand carry it out on Dec
16. No problem for extra postage, though you may need to separate into two invoices. Can you
please send me the revised quote as well as your UK bank details. | can pay using my Barclay's
account online so can have the money there as soon as you send the quote

The second sensor and the Tek-Ox goes to HK

First sensor

C/- Derek Holwill
Hailsham chambers, 4 Paper Buildings, Temple, London EC4Y 7EX.

Tek-ox and second sensor

C/- Charles Cox
G/F

732 Tan Cheung
Sai Kung, NT
Hong Kong SAR

Mobile: +852 64433710
Thanks
Rick

On Mon, 12 Nov 2018 at 19:43, Jean Lamb <jean.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Rick,

Thank you for your enquiry. Please see attached a proforma invoice showing costs to send to
Hong Kong.
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If you prefer shipping by UPS | will need full physical address in Hong Kong. If you decide to
go for only the sensors the shipping cost will be less - let me know if you need cost.

Regards
Jean Lamb
#Vandagraph
12th Nov18

On Sat, Nov 10, 2018 at 11:07 PM Rick Kirkham / Frontier Scuba <frontierscuba@gmail.com>
wrote:
Hi Jean

I need to order two more sensors for the Tek-ox. Also, | would possibly like to order one
more tek-ox. How much are they? Please quote VAT free for carriage to HK

Thanks

Rick

On 26/04/2018 08:38, Rick Kirkham / Frontier Scuba wrote:
Hi Jean
I need to order two O2 sensor for Tek_ox. Also, | need one sensor for the
Divesoft Helium-Oxygen analyser. It is a type 22 . Do you carry them? Please
quote VAT free with carriage to Hong Kong

regards

Rick
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Richard A. Kirkham
Owner
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