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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Need Quotation
1 message

Pritee Dehukar <pritee@carenx.com> 3 January 2022 at 11:33
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk, Accounts Admin <accounts@carenx.com>

Hi Kate,

Please provide your signature with a stamp on the updated invoice. It is mandatory for bank documentation for
payment. 

Thanks,
Pritee Dehukar
Senior Operations Manager - caremother.in
Ph: (+91) 8446558954

106, First Floor, A Wing, Greenscape Technocity, Ghansoli, Navi Mumbai - 400710


On Mon, Jan 3, 2022 at 1:32 PM Pritee Dehukar <pritee@carenx.com> wrote:

Hi Kate, 


Thanks for your quick response earlier. 
We wanted to do the payment, submitted the documents to the bank but due to some reason documents came
back to us. The performa invoice was valid by 26th December 2021. Kindly share updated performa invoice so that
we can do the payment this week. 


Thanks,
Pritee Dehukar
Senior Operations Manager - caremother.in

Ph: (+91) 8446558954

106, First Floor, A Wing, Greenscape Technocity, Ghansoli, Navi Mumbai - 400710








On Thu, Nov 25, 2021 at 3:31 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Good morning Pritee,


Please see attached proforma invoice as requested.  Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.


I am unable to give an expected delivery date due to the global shortage of components.  All I can say is the lead
time is expected to be approximately 10 weeks, but this is subject to change.  I am sorry I cannot be more
specific.


Many thanks.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.
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taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.


If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------




On Thu, 25 Nov 2021 at 05:58, Pritee Dehukar <pritee@carenx.com> wrote:


Dear Kate, 


Thank you for the quick response. Yes, we are interested to buy the V1000. 




Quantity:1 

Name of the Company: CareNX Innovations Pvt Ltd
Address:  106, First Floor, A Wing, Greenscape Technocity, Shilphata - Mahape   

          Road, Near Country Inn Hotel, MIDC Industrial Area, Ghansoli, Navi 
          Mumbai, 400710 India.


Please share Performa Invoice with all the charges & expected delivery date. I will share PO asap. 
Please let me know what else details you will require from us. 





Thanks,
Pritee Dehukar
Senior Operations Manager - caremother.in

Ph: (+91) 8446558954

106, First Floor, A Wing, Greenscape Technocity, Ghansoli, Navi Mumbai - 400710








On Tue, Nov 23, 2021 at 5:37 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Good morning Pritee,


Thank you for your email.  The price of the V1000, part number 1410000 is $950 (USD) EXW. 
Unfortunately, there is a global shortage of components for this device, so production has stopped until we
can rectify this.


The very approximate lead time is 9-10 weeks.


This item does not have a CE certificate, as it is a non medical device (test equipment).



If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, bank charges and insurance, I would need your
invoice and delivery addresses in order to set up a new account for you.


If you prefer to wait until we have stock before receiving a proforma invoice (which is only valid for 30 days),
I could let you know when production is resumed.


Many thanks.


Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.



http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582


Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd


Company registered in England, No. 01291765.


E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.


If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------




On Tue, 23 Nov 2021 at 11:21, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:






---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Pritee Dehukar <pritee@carenx.com>

Date: Tue, 23 Nov 2021 at 11:19

Subject: Need Quotation

To: <info@viamed.co.uk>, <sales@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Neha Chandrakumar <neha@caremother.in>, Shantanu Pathak <shantanu@caremother.in>





Dear Sir/ Madam, 


We are CareNX Innovations Pvt Limited from India. We are interested to know the cost of the V1000
Foetal Heart Simulator. Kindly provide the quotation. Also, provide an idea on purchase. How we can
procure it. Please also share the compliance you follows like CE certificate & other standards. 




Also please let us know the delivery time. Please let us know in case of any clarity. 




Thanks,
Pritee Dehukar
Senior Operations Manager - caremother.in

Ph: (+91) 8446558954

106, First Floor, A Wing, Greenscape Technocity, Ghansoli, Navi Mumbai - 400710
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