22/12/2021, 09:59 Gmail - Re: Re: Purchase Order RR8N400237830 - Ticket [50356]

M Gmall Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Re: Re: Purchase Order RR8N400237830 - Ticket [50356]

eProcurement <Ith.eprocurement@nhs.net>
Reply-To: eProcurement <Ith.eprocurement@nhs.net>
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Hi Zoey,

| can confirm we are happy to proceed with this order.
Could you put the carriage charge into the invoice.
Kind Regards,

Terelle

! Terelle Reardon
: Data Quality Officer

Leeds Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust
i Education Training and Development Centre
- St James University Hospital, Leeds LS9 7TF

D4-eProcurement:*|th.eprocurement@nhs.net

The team greatly appreciate any constructive feedback - positive or negative. Feel free to provide it here.

On Wed, 22 Dec at 9:43 AM , John Huggett <j.huggett@nhs.net> wrote:
Hi Terelle

Yes we are happy to proceed with this order.
Kind regards
John
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