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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Your order

1 message

g.a.nadeem amin <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com> 21 December 2021 at 11:15
Reply-To: "g.a.nadeem amin" <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

+447405964309 this number in my use


Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Tue, 21 Dec 2021 at 11:06 am, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Nadeem,

I will do, I am just checking the carriage charge is still the same.  I really do need your telephone number so
Cathy can ring you later.  Thank you.

I will email you with the updated order and the amount you owe as soon as I can.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.
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On Tue, 21 Dec 2021 at 10:57, g.a.nadeem amin <ganadeem2001@yahoo.com> wrote:

Please add this in my order. Then I can payment. 



Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android


On Tue, 21 Dec 2021 at 10:32 am, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi again, part number 4420800 costs £84 each EXW, we only have one in stock.
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