17/12/2021, 13:28 Gmail - Fwd: 4310002 SpiroTrue APC flowsensor

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: 4310002 SpiroTrue APC flowsensor

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Dec 17, 2021 at 1:11 PM
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal
<zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: tatyana pak <tatyana.pakO8@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 17 Dec 2021, 12:24

Subject: Re: 4310002 SpiroTrue APC flowsensor
To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Cc: Danil Malevich <6385208@gmail.com>

Dear Ryan,
I've made a mistake in my previous letter. | need 30 boxes of 5, not 30 pcs.

| am looking forward to hearing from you.
best regards,
Tatyana Pak

nT, 17 gek. 2021 r. B 09:26, tatyana pak <tatyana.pakO8@gmail.com>:
Dear Ryan,
| would like to order 30 pcs of the SpiroTrue APC flowsensor 4310002
last time we have already ordered them.
this time could you please make an order for my name as a private person (without mentioning Medtrest) and send
me an invoice.
here is my information:

Tatyana Pak

TAX number: PKATYN73L622255X

address: via Carrebbio 33, Gussago (BS), 25064, Italia
tel: +393341506122

| would very appreciate your reply

best regards,
Tatyana
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