06/12/2021, 10:37 Gmail - Fwd: MAX250E///120PCS

M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: MAX250E///[120PCS

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 6 December 2021 at 10:24
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi
Please can we send a proforma invoice for 120x MAX-250E
Company: AN AN Import Export - CID15101

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Trinh Phwong <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 6 Dec 2021 at 05:23

Subject: Re: MAX250E///120PCS

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

Pls send me PI for 120pcs MAX250E. | need COO as usual.

Vao Th 6, 3 thg 12, 2021 IGc 11:22 Trinh Phwong <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> da viét:
Dear Ryan,

Hope you will receive this email well.
We have plan to order 120pcs Max250E.
Are they available in your stock?

TRINH PHUONG

DT: 0987 546 072

CONG TY TNHH SX TM XNK AN AN

D/C: 497/123/14 THONG NHAT, P.16, Q.GO VAP, TP.HCM

TRINH PHUONG

DT: 0987 546 072

CONG TY TNHH SX TM XNK AN AN

D/C: 497/123/14 THONG NHAT, P.16, Q.GO VAP, TP.HCM

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1718391972841193912%7Cmsg-f%3A1718391972... 1/1


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:trinhphuong2606@gmail.com
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
mailto:trinhphuong2606@gmail.com
https://www.google.com/maps/search/123%2F14+TH%E1%BB%90NG+NH%E1%BA%A4T?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/123%2F14+TH%E1%BB%90NG+NH%E1%BA%A4T?entry=gmail&source=g

