M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: BCD flow restrictor kits for VN202

1 message

john routley <john@narkedat90.com> 1 December 2021 at 15:02
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Thanks buddy

Kind Regards,
Uskn /Pﬂ«lf/ay

J. ROUTLEY
Tel: +44(0)1933 681255

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 01 December 2021 14:02

To: john routley <john@narkedat90.com>

Subject: Re: BCD flow restrictor kits for VN202

Hi John
No problem, I'll put 5x together for you.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 1 Dec 2021 at 13:55, john routley <john@narkedat90.com> wrote:

| don’t think to many, if you have 3to5 I'll have those, should keep me going for a while
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Kind Regards,
Tokn /@alf/e/

J. ROUTLEY
Tel: +44(0)1933 681255

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 01 December 2021 13:54

To: john routley <john@narkedat90.com>

Subject: Re: BCD flow restrictor kits for VN202

Thanks John

| can probably put together 6-10, would that be okay?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 1 Dec 2021 at 13:45, john routley <john@narkedat90.com> wrote:

Thanks ryan, | had guessed at £40@)

Ok I'll take the sets you have please and I'll make the website live today

Kind Regards,
Unkn /@af/ef

J. ROUTLEY
Tel: +44(0)1933 681255
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 01 December 2021 12:17

To: john routley <john@narkedat90.com>

Subject: Re: BCD flow restrictor kits for VN202

Hi John

| am sorry for the delay.

The trade price would be £30 and the retail price would be £40

We have a handful available from stock.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 30 Nov 2021 at 09:45, john routley <john@narkedat90.com> wrote:

Thanks ryan, asap if you can, | have someone waiting for it, they have the din kit and the analyser but wasn’t
to expand the kit.

Kind Regards,
Tnbn leﬂaf/ef

J. ROUTLEY
Tel: +44(0)1933 681255

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: 30 November 2021 09:19
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To: john routley <john@narkedat90.com>
Subject: Re: BCD flow restrictor kits for VN202

Hi John

This kit is normally supplied as part of the AD300 and MD300, we can supply it separately but | do not have it
priced. | will work something out for you.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 29 Nov 2021 at 11:54, john routley <john@narkedat90.com> wrote:
Sorry buddy,

All this is the kit we have...see attched

Kind Regards,
Jotn /@M/ef

J. ROUTLEY
Tel: +44(0)1933 681255

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Steve Nixon

Sent: 29 November 2021 11:45

To: john routley <john@narkedat90.com>

Cc: jean.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk; Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Subject: Re: BCD flow restrictor kits for VN202

Hi John

This one is for Vandagraph not VST, I'll pass it on to Jean and Ryan.
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Regards

Steve

On Mon, 29 Nov 2021 at 11:31, john routley <john@narkedat90.com> wrote:

Hi steve we have the bcd restrictor kits for the vn202 but | have no idea of its retail price or irs trade
price.

| though we had them on the website but its turns out we have them in a basket but not on the website.
Any idea on pricing?

Kind Regards,

John Routley

J. ROUTLEY

Tel: +44(0)1933 681255
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Or Accounting: accounts@narkedat90.com

The contents of this email are confidential in nature and is a copyright work belonging to Na90. This
email may not be copied or disseminated without the prior authorisation of the author, whether by
forwarding or copying this email in reply except as stated below.

The recipient of this email may reply to the author with a copy of this email attached but may not copy
other addressees. By replying to the author with a copy of this email attached, the recipient agrees that
Na90 may use the contents of this email in any way, including distribution to third parties. The recipient
also waives the right to any confidentiality notice applied to their correspondance. This email is intended
for the above named addressee only.

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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