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M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Wye Valley NHS Trust Offical Purchase Order 000200729

1 message

Supplies <supplies@wvt.nhs.uk> 1 December 2021 at 13:45
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,
We are happy for you to proceed with the order.

Kind regards

Helen

Helen Langford | Buyer
Foundation Group Procurement Shared Service

Email: helen.langford@wvt.nhs.uk or via Teams

NHS B NHS|

George Eliot Hospital ~ South Warwickshire  wye Valley
NHS Trust NHS Foundation Trust NHS Trust

No PO No Pay will be implemented from 2022

Please ensure official Purchase Order Numbers are raised appropriately and quoted on all invoices

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 01 December 2021 13:22

To: Supplies <supplies@wvt.nhs.uk>

Subject: Re: Wye Valley NHS Trust Offical Purchase Order 000200729

Good afternoon Helen,

Thank you for your PO 000200729 . Please could | advise you that the price of part number 1114005 has increased?
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The prices for EyeMax are as follows:

1114005 - EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Regular Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 32 - 38 cm. Pack of 20
= £43.70

1114006 - EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Premie Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 26 - 32 cm. Pack of 20
=£41.90

1114007 - EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Micro Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 20 - 26 cm. Pack of
20 = £37.80

UK postage charges:

1 pack: £6.00
2 - 4 packs: £8.00
5 packs or more: £10.00

Please let me know if you would like us to proceed with the price of £43.70 each and carriage charge of £8.
Many thanks.
Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 1 Dec 2021 at 13:15, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <supplies@wvt.nhs.uk>

Date: Wed, 1 Dec 2021 at 13:10

Subject: Wye Valley NHS Trust Offical Purchase Order 000200729
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Please find attached a copy of purchase order for Wye Valley NHS Trust.

Please view the attachment for details.

<ATTACH_HTML>

“Any opinion expressed in this e-mail or any attached files are those of the individual and not necessarily those of
Herefordshire Council, Herefordshire Clinical Commissioning Group (HCCG), Wye Valley NHS Trust or
Gloucestershire Health and Care Foundation Trust. You should be aware that Herefordshire Council, Herefordshire
Clinical Commissioning Group (HCCG), Wye Valley NHS Trust & Gloucestershire Health and Care Foundation Trust
monitors their email service. This e-mail and any attached files are confidential and intended solely for the use of the
addressee. This communication may contain material protected by law from being passed on. If you are not the
intended recipient and have received this e-mail in error, you are advised that any use, dissemination, forwarding,
printing or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error please contact the
sender immediately and destroy all copies of it.”
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