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M Gmail

Fwd: Purchase order A/210174

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Maria Iglesias <maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com>
Date: Fri, 26 Nov 2021 at 15:53

Subject: RE: Purchase order A/210174

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

26 November 2021 at 16:18

Cc: Administracion <administracion@prhoinsa.com>, Amelia Aragén <a.aragon@prhoinsa.com>

Hi Ryan Carburos has answered.

They will cut down the order to 97 units as is enough for them now.

They cannot accept manufacture date older than 6 months so there is not chance to use your old stock.

Please amend the order to 97 units.

Best Regards,

Maria Iglesias

Medical Division

Phone: +34 91 426 17 12
Fax: +34 91 431 26 58
Cell: +34 608 809 499

Skype: maria.iglesias75
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PRHOINSA trabaja para sus clientes, le invitamos a que cumplimente esta encuesta de satisfaccion para ayudarnos a
seguir trabajando en la mejora continua.

https://es.surveymonkey.com/r/PY9GNNL

This message and its attachments are intended solely for the addressee and may contain confidential information subject to professional secrecy. No
reproduction is forbidden or distribution without the express authorization of PROYECTOS HOSPITALARIOS INTERNACIONAL, S.A (
hereinafter PRHOINSA). If you are not the final recipient please delete and inform us in this way.

In accordance with the provisions of Law 15/1999 of December 13, Protection of Personal Data (LOPD), we inform you that your data is
stored in a file which is owned PRHOINSA in order to perform administrative, accounting and tax, and send communications regarding our
products and / or services that may be of interest.

We also inform you of the possibility of exercising rights of access, rectification, cancellation and opposition of their data in the tax domicile of
PRHOINSA located at C/JOSE ABASCAL, 55 — 2° DERECHA. 28003 - MADRID.

If you do not wish to receive information, please contact us by sending an email to the following address: administracion@prhoinsa.com

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] En nombre de Ryan Swaine
Enviado el: jueves, 25 de noviembre de 2021 17:33

Para: Maria Iglesias

Asunto: Re: Purchase order A/210174

Thanks Maria

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

On Thu, 25 Nov 2021, 16:31 Maria Iglesias, <maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com> wrote:

Ok Ryan i have advices Carburos today. We’ll see what they decide.

Best Regards,

Maria Iglesias

Medical Division

Phone: +34 91 426 17 12
Fax: +34 91 431 26 58
Cell: +34 608 809 499

Skype: maria.iglesias75
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PRHOINSA trabaja para sus clientes, le invitamos a que cumplimente esta encuesta de satisfaccion para ayudarnos a
seguir trabajando en la mejora continua.
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This message and its attachments are intended solely for the addressee and may contain confidential information subject to professional secrecy. No
reproduction is forbidden or distribution without the express authorization of PROYECTOS HOSPITALARIOS INTERNACIONAL, S.A (
hereinafter PRHOINSA). If you are not the final recipient please delete and inform us in this way.

In accordance with the provisions of Law 15/1999 of December 13, Protection of Personal Data (LOPD), we inform you that your data is
stored in a file which is owned PRHOINSA in order to perform administrative, accounting and tax, and send communications regarding our

products and / or services that may be of interest.

We also inform you of the possibility of exercising rights of access, rectification, cancellation and opposition of their data in the tax domicile of
PRHOINSA located at C/JOSE ABASCAL, 55 — 2° DERECHA. 28003 - MADRID.

If you do not wish to receive information, please contact us by sending an email to the following address: administracion@prhoinsa.com

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] En nombre de Ryan Swaine
Enviado el: jueves, 25 de noviembre de 2021 16:05

Para: Maria Iglesias

Asunto: Re: Purchase order A/210174

Hi Maria

Yes, unfortunately nothing definite, but one of the guys at Teledyne is going to try and track down some stock for
us, so hopefully we are not going to have to wait so long. Unfortunately it is unlikely that we will get a
definitive answer until after the ThanksGiving holidays.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 25 Nov 2021 at 14:49, Maria Iglesias <maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com> wrote:

HI Ryan any news about EDD from Teledyne?

Best Regards,

Maria Iglesias
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Medical Division

Phone: +34 91426 17 12
Fax: +34 91431 26 58
Cell: +34 608 809 499

Skype: maria.iglesias75
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PRHOINSA trabaja para sus clientes, le invitamos a que cumplimente esta encuesta de satisfaccion para ayudarnos a
seguir trabajando en la mejora continua.

https://es.surveymonkey.com/r/PY9OGNNL

This message and its attachments are intended solely for the addressee and may contain confidential information subject to professional secrecy. No
reproduction is forbidden or distribution without the express authorization of PROYECTOS HOSPITALARIOS INTERNACIONAL, S.A (

hereinafter PRHOINSA). If you are not the final recipient please delete and inform us in this way.

In accordance with the provisions of Law 15/1999 of December 13, Protection of Personal Data (LOPD), we inform you that your data is

stored in a file which is owned PRHOINSA in order to perform administrative, accounting and tax, and send communications regarding our

products and / or services that may be of interest.

We also inform you of the possibility of exercising rights of access, rectification, cancellation and opposition of their data in the tax domicile of
PRHOINSA located at C/JOSE ABASCAL, 55— 2° DERECHA. 28003 - MADRID.

If you do not wish to receive information, please contact us by sending an email to the following address: administracion@prhoinsa.com

De: Maria Iglesias [mailto:maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com]
Enviado el: martes, 23 de noviembre de 2021 17:29
Para: 'ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk'

CC: 'Administracién'; 'Cathy Green'; 'Sarah Walton'; 'amelia’
Asunto: RE: Purchase order A/210174

Ok Ryan let me know as soon as possible and we will as Carburos what they want to do.

Best Regards,

Maria Iglesias

Medical Division

Phone: +34 91 426 17 12
Fax: +34 91 431 26 58
Cell: +34 608 809 499

Skype: maria.iglesias75
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PRHOINSA trabaja para sus clientes, le invitamos a que cumplimente esta encuesta de satisfaccion para ayudarnos a
seguir trabajando en la mejora continua.

https://es.surveymonkey.com/r/PYOGNNL

This message and its attachments are intended solely for the addressee and may contain confidential information subject to professional secrecy. No
reproduction is forbidden or distribution without the express authorization of PROYECTOS HOSPITALARIOS INTERNACIONAL, S.A (
hereinafter PRHOINSA). If you are not the final recipient please delete and inform us in this way.

In accordance with the provisions of Law 15/1999 of December 13, Protection of Personal Data (LOPD), we inform you that your data is
stored in a file which is owned PRHOINSA in order to perform administrative, accounting and tax, and send communications regarding our
products and / or services that may be of interest.

We also inform you of the possibility of exercising rights of access, rectification, cancellation and opposition of their data in the tax domicile of
PRHOINSA located at C/JOSE ABASCAL, 55— 2° DERECHA. 28003 - MADRID.

If you do not wish to receive information, please contact us by sending an email to the following address: administracion@prhoinsa.com

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] En nombre de Ryan Swaine
Enviado el: martes, 23 de noviembre de 2021 12:59

Para: Maria Iglesias

CC: Administracion; Cathy Green; Sarah Walton; amelia

Asunto: Re: Purchase order A/210174

Hi Maria

Unfortunately | do not have good news regarding the 3x sensors. As Sarah mentioned we can supply you from
stock, but the date code is for November 2020 (this has no impact on the warranty period).

If you want to proceed with 3x new sensors, then it could be up to 10 weeks. One of my colleagues is going to
speak with Teledyne this evening to see if they have any sensors in stock with a later manufacturing date, we
will come back to you as soon as we have an answer.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar1529905711798394748%7Cmsg-f%3A171750826... 5/8


http://www.prhoinsa.es/
https://es.surveymonkey.com/r/PY9GNNL
https://www.google.com/maps/search/C%2FJOS%C3%89+ABASCAL,+55+%E2%80%93+2%C2%BA?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:administracion@prhoinsa.com
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy

26/11/2021, 16:21 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase order A/210174

On Thu, 18 Nov 2021 at 17:36, Maria Iglesias <maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com> wrote:
This Customer has a mandatory date for the cells so i think we cannot accept old stock.

When is expect to receive the 3 replaces?

Best Regards,

Maria Iglesias

Medical Division

Phone: +34 91 426 17 12
Fax: +34 91 431 26 58
Cell: +34 608 809 499

Skype: maria.iglesias75
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PRHOINSA trabaja para sus clientes, le invitamos a que cumplimente esta encuesta de satisfaccion para
ayudarnos a seguir trabajando en la mejora continua.

https://es.surveymonkey.com/r/PYOGNNL

This message and its attachments are intended solely for the addressee and may contain confidential information subject to
professional secrecy. No reproduction is forbidden or distribution without the express authorization of PROYECTOS HOSPITALARIOS
INTERNACIONAL, S.A (hereinafter PRHOINSA). If you are not the final recipient please delete and inform us in this way.

In accordance with the provisions of Law 15/1999 of December 13, Protection of Personal Data (LOPD), we inform you that your data is
stored in a file which is owned PRHOINSA in order to perform administrative, accounting and tax, and send communications regarding our
products and / or services that may be of interest.

We also inform you of the possibility of exercising rights of access, rectification, cancellation and opposition of their data in the tax domicile of
PRHOINSA located at C/JOSE ABASCAL, 55— 2° DERECHA. 28003 - MADRID.

If you do not wish to receive information, please contact us by sending an email to the following address: administracion@prhoinsa.com

De: Administracion [mailto:administracion@prhoinsa.com]

Enviado el: jueves, 18 de noviembre de 2021 15:40

Para: 'Maria Iglesias'

CC: 'Ryan Swaine'; 'Cathy Green'; sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk; amelia
Asunto: RE: Purchase order A/210174

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar1529905711798394748%7Cmsg-f%3A171750826... 6/8


mailto:maria.iglesias@prhoinsa.com
http://www.prhoinsa.es/
https://es.surveymonkey.com/r/PY9GNNL
https://www.google.com/maps/search/C%2FJOS%C3%89+ABASCAL,+55+%E2%80%93+2%C2%BA?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:administracion@prhoinsa.com
mailto:administracion@prhoinsa.com
mailto:sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

26/11/2021, 16:21 Gmail - Fwd: Purchase order A/210174

Hello Maria,

Could you please give them a response?

Thank you!

Leonor Jiménez

Dpto. Administracion
PRHOINSA

C/ JOSE ABASCAL 55, 22D
28003 MADRID

Tel: 91426 17 12

www.prhoinsa.es
administracion@prhoinsa.com
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Sarah Walton

Enviado el: jueves, 18 de noviembre de 2021 14:18

Para: Administracion Administracion <administracion@prhoinsa.com>

CC: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>; Cathy Green <cathy.green@viamed.co.uk>
Asunto: Purchase order A/210174

Dear Leonor,

Please be advised that 97 x T-1 sensors passed our QA process, however 3 out of the 100 failed. We do
have older stock (date code Nov 2020) that we can offer as the 3 replacements.

Please can you advise how you would like to proceed with this order.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@yviamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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