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M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Shipment ready

1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 26 November 2021 at 15:16

To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>
Dear Sarah,
OKk.ill contact Skycargo express again.some time they delay
Yes. Please send proforma invoice for latest order.
Thank you,
Best regards,
Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Nov 26, 2021, 8:09 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Sudath,

We are still waiting for your freight forwarder to contact us regarding the 10 x R-24MED.

Yes we do have stock of the MAX-250E and the SpiroTrue Flow sensor A(PC). Do you want me to send you a
proforma invoice?

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.
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On Fri, 26 Nov 2021 at 14:20, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

The TT payment forms already sent the bank to send pending payment. it's delayed to week due to currency
matter.

We got the another order today for 40 pcs Flow sensors and 20 pcs MAX-250E.Stocks are available?
How is the last order 10 pcs R-24MED Oxygen sensors? It is collected ?

Thank you,

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Mon, Nov 15, 2021, 7:10 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Sudath,

Glad that you have received your parcel.
I can confirm that we have received a payment of £333.00 into our bank.
Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.
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On Mon, 15 Nov 2021 at 11:56, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

The package was received today..Thank you very much.

The payment can be settle within two weeks.
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The 10 Pcs R-24,MED Oxygen sensors payment already settled last week..
It has received? Plz check and confirm.
Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Nov 12, 2021, 9:09 PM Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

Thank you for the arranged package R-24MED Oxygen Sensors, we will inform the Skycargo express for
the collection.

Yesterday | settled the payment for the above 10 Pcs R-24MED order, viaTT, (MVM133118 / GBP-358.00)
please check with the bank.

Best regards.

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Nov 12, 2021 at 6:26 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Sudath,

Please be advised that your parcel for the 10 x R-24MED sensors is now ready for collecting.
| have attached a copy of your commercial invoice detailing weight and dimensions for your reference.
Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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