25/11/2021, 15:39 Gmail - Re: Request for supply of sensors

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Request for supply of sensors
1 message

Saiba Pharmacy <saibapharmacy@gmail.com> 25 November 2021 at 15:33

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Ms. Kate
Greetings
Really we appreciate your quick response to our request.
Please find below our Delivery and Invoice address as follows.
Unit 44 A&B, Building- 46, Road- 338, Sheaikh Ateyatallah Bin Abdulrahaman avenue, Block- 337, Um Al Hassam,
Manama. Kingdom of Bahrain.
Phone # +973 17260085,
+973 39618336(M)
Request you to also please send us HS code for the parts requested.

Looking for your reply and hop to have long and fruitful business partnership with your company.
Best Regards
Mrs Kirti Sanjay Lakade

Saiba Pharmacy.
Bahrain.

On Thu, 25 Nov 2021, 11:32 am Kate Griffiths, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

Thank you for your email.

The prices are as follows:

R-30V part number 0110040 $70 each EXW currently in stock
R-43V (pack of 2) part number 0110043 $87.50 each EXW currently in stock
R-23V part number 0110023 $43.75 each EXW currently in stock
R-17MED part number 0110017 $34.50 each very low stock

If you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, bank charges and insurance, | would need your
delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 24 Nov 2021 at 16:21, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Saiba Pharmacy <saibapharmacy@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 24 Nov 2021 at 16:17

Subject: Request for supply of sensors

To: <info@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir/ Madam
Greetings
Request you to please send us quotation for the below mentioned items.

Oxygen sensor Model Required Quantity

R-30V 3 Sensors

R-43V 1 Pack (Pack of 2 Sensors)
R-23V 2 Sensors

R-17 MED 2 Sensors

Appreciate your best quote CIF. Kingdom of Bahrain.
Thanking you in anticipation.

Best regards

Saiba Pharmacy

Um Al Hassam

Manama

Kingdom of Bahrain

1973 39296422
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