25/11/2021, 08:45 Gmail - Re: Oxygen Analyser information

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen Analyser information
1 message

David Clarke <david.clarke@vetsltd.uk> 25 November 2021 at 08:44

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate
The handi unit please
| need it ASAP please

On Thu, 25 Nov 2021 at 08:25, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi David,

We would need to put your order on and as you are a proforma customer, my colleague Cathy Green would ring
you to take payment (if you would like to pay by card). We are unable to take the payment at the office in person.

If you let me know your requirements, | can send you a proforma invoice and if you are happy with it, | would make
it a confirmed order and Cathy could ring you to take payment. She could then discuss with you when it would be
available for collection.

Please let me know if you require any further assistance.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.
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On Thu, 25 Nov 2021 at 07:52, David Clarke <david.clarke@vetsltd.uk> wrote:
Hi Kate
What time do open so | can come on and collect
| live in Keighley
Best regards
David

On Wed, 24 Nov 2021 at 09:48, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
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Good morning David,
Further to your telephone call earlier, please see attached our oxygen monitoring catalogue so you can see if
there is a suitable analyser/monitor for your needs. (Please note the AX300 and MX300 are no longer
available).

If there are any you are specifically interested in and require information as to whether it would suit your needs,
please let us know, and myself or Steve Hardaker would be able to assist you.

Some prices are as follows:

_0111275 Oxygen analyser OxiQuant S £155 each, plus £10 carriage plus VAT. (currently
511?202(:5% Handi+ Oxygen analyser with integral sensor £172 each, plus £10 carriage plus VAT. (currently
311 ?20206% MAXO2+A £315 each, plus £10 carriage plus VAT. (currently
511?:102063 MAXO2+AE £325 each, plus £10 carriage plus VAT. (currently
in stoc

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance.
Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.
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David Clarke

Veterinary Equipment Technical Services

(Trading name of Medical Equipment Technical Services)
Weasel Wood House Farm

Woodhouse Road

Keighley

West Yorkshire

BD21 5QX

m: 07736060803

e: david.clarke@vetsltd.uk

David Clarke
Veterinary Equipment Technical Services
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