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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Quotation Request
1 message

Hussein <h-ghandour@hotmail.com> 24 November 2021 at 13:10
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

please proceed the Soonest is qty 11 and later on will check the drager .
technomed


Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 24, 2021, at 2:49 PM, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Hi Hussein,

Thank you for your email.  Ryan has confirmed that the T-7V (0110058) is a suitable alternative/is
compatible with the MOX-4.  We have the T-7V in stock.

Unfortunately, I am unable to tell which sensor you need - "Drager anesthesia Machine Oxygen
Sensor".  Are you able to give me more information please?

Thank you.


Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered
remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Wed, 24 Nov 2021 at 12:25, Hussein <h-ghandour@hotmail.com> wrote:

Hello Kate 
please follow closely and get the answer as it is to urgent to get them the soonest as possible.


best Regards 
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Sent from my iPhone



On Nov 24, 2021, at 12:05 PM, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:




﻿
Hi Ryan,


Should I offer the T-7V for the Mox-4 please?  Hard to tell from i/stat photos if it is the
same.  I will ask for more details regarding the Drager sensor he mentioned.


Thank you.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin
staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the
main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to use email where
possible.
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On Tue, 23 Nov 2021 at 20:43, houssein ghandour <h-ghandour@hotmail.com> wrote:


Dear Kate

Please in need qty 11 of the Oxygen sensor below .

Invoice to TechnoMed Details , please mention your bank details and your paypal
account

[cid:0856a847-0068-4b28-a645-72474c2788e8@eurprd09.prod.outlook.com]

Need Qty 1 Drager anesthesia Machine Oxygen Sensor







Best Regards
___________________________

Hussein  Ghandour

TechnoMed s.a.r.l

Tel: +961-3-125919 | +961-70-353512

H-Ghandour@hotmail.com<mailto:H-Ghandour@hotmail.com>

https://techno-med.org/
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