
Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Analox O2 cells

1 message

csmeinert <csmeinert@aol.com> 22 November 2021 at 21:46
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello Ryan,

Thanks for clarifying that. The sensors will be bought through our training company.

STATS 2000
12 Coulston Road 
Lancaster LA1 3AE 

Phone 07766287097

A trade discount would be welcome. 

We can pay by bank transfer 

Please quote for  one each of.

ATA: R-22AT
O2 EII: R-33DE
Plus postage

Best regards 

C Stewart Meinert
ASSET Chief Instructor

Sent from my Galaxy

-------- Original message --------
From: Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: 22/11/2021 16:53 (GMT+00:00)
To: csmeinert <csmeinert@aol.com>
Subject: Re: Analox O2 cells

Dear Stuart

Thank you very much for your enquiry. 

I have listed the sensors you require below:

ATA: R-22AT = £45 each EXW
O2 EII: R-33DE = £45 each EXW
Postage by RM Signed For to a UK address = £6

Total including VAT = GBP £115.20

Please can you let me know if the sensors are to be invoiced to ASSET? If so, we may be able to look into trade
pricing for you.

If you would like to proceed with an order, please let me know your complete delivery/invoice address details. If you
would like to pay by bank transfer, I can send you a quotation with our account information or you can give us a call
with your credit card details.

https://www.google.com/maps/search/12+Coulston+Road+Lancaster+LA1+3AE?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/12+Coulston+Road+Lancaster+LA1+3AE?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:csmeinert@aol.com


I look forward to your reply and please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sun, 21 Nov 2021 at 09:46, csmeinert <csmeinert@aol.com> wrote:

Hello,


I have both an Analox ATA Pro tri-mix analyser and an Analox O2 EII O2 analyser.


I need one cell for each of these.


Attached are photos of the units and the cells they contain. Please confirm that you have compatible cell in stock.
And which are the correct replacements.


Best regards 


C Stewart Meinert
Chief instructor.
Association of Scuba Service Engineers and Technicians 
Phone 07766287087


Sent from my Galaxy

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:csmeinert@aol.com

